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Mission Statement  

 
Danville Area Community College is committed to providing 

quality, innovative, and accessible learning experiences which 
meet the life-long academic, cultural, and economic needs of 

our diverse communities and the world we share. 
          

  
 
        
 
 
         



 
 
 
  
  

Danville Area Community College will continue to be an active partner in building and maintaining 
academic excellence and economic vitality in the diverse communities it serves. This will be 
accomplished by: 

 
 Creating a learning culture where assessment of student academic achievement is valued and 

used across the institution, departments, and programs to improve learning; 
 Providing a friendly and dynamic environment in which to learn and grow; 
 Embracing the ever-changing world of technology; 
 Offering an affordable and convenient education for learners; 
 Promoting a global perspective of education; 
 Reflecting diversity and inclusiveness in our students, faculty, and staff; 
 Cultivating partnerships with the community to develop innovative and vital solutions to meet 

changing academic and economic needs; 
 Challenging students to explore their full potential through rigorous academics, diverse campus 

organizations, and innovative career experiences; and 
 Enhancing opportunities for student success through comprehensive services. 

 

Core Values 

Integrity     
Trusting relationships and an ethical reputation with those we serve (students, faculty, employees, 
community, business, other educational institutions, government). 

Excellence 
Consistently achieving exceptional results that delight those we serve. 

Communication 
Positive and productive relationships and environment for those we serve. 

Adaptability 
Continuously meeting the changing needs of those we serve. 

Diversity 
Providing a safe and secure learning environment for the personal and intellectual growth of those we 
serve, preparing them to participate in an increasingly changing world.   
 

Vision Statement 



 

BOARD OF TRUSTEES 
Community College District No. 507 

Regular Meeting 
DACC Board Room, Vermilion Hall 302 

Thursday, July 20, 2017 
5:30 p.m. 

 

AGENDA 

1. Call to Order 

2. Pledge of Allegiance 

3. Roll Call 

4. Adoption of Agenda 

5. Recognition of Visitors 

6. Liberal Arts and Library Services Report 

7. President’s Report 

8. Public Comment 

 

10.    Unfinished Business 

11.    New Business 

A. Board Consideration of Approval of Travel Expenditures for Trustees 

B. Board Consideration of Authorization to Permit Interfund Loans as Needed for the 

Period of August 2017 Through July 2018 

C. Board Consideration to Acquire Property Located at 18 Tillman Avenue 

D. Board Consideration for Intercollegiate Sports Accident Insurance for FY2018 

E. Board Consideration to Lease Two (2) 15-Passenger Minibuses 

F. Board Consideration of Acquisition of the Carnegie Library 

G. Board Consideration of Naming Opportunities 

12. Information 

 A. Communications 

   

 

Consent Agenda Items are considered to be routine, non-controversial matters and will be considered together and 
enacted by one motion and one roll call.  Any Trustee desiring to remove an item for separate consideration should 
so request before approval of the agenda. 
 

9. Consent Agenda  

A. Board Consideration of the Minutes of the Regular Board Meeting of                       

June 22, 2017 

B. Financial Report 

C. Human Resources Report 

D. Board Consideration of Board Policy Revision 

1. Board Policy #4052 – Sick Leave and Personal Business Leave 



 Danville Area Community College 
 Board Meeting Agenda, Page 2 
 July 20, 2017 

 

AUGUST 2017 

         16-18 Staff In-Service Days 

  21 Fall Classes Begin 

  24 DACC Board of Trustees Meeting, 5:30 p.m., Vermilion Hall Room 302 

SEPTEMBER 2017 

    4 Labor Day Holiday – College Closed 

  21 College Day, Mary Miller Gym 

  22 DACC Foundation Honors Program, 10:00 a.m., Mary Miller Gym 

  28 DACC Board of Trustees Meeting, 5:30 p.m., Vermilion Hall Room 302 

 OCTOBER 2017 

    6 Faculty/Staff In-Service Days, No Classes 

    9 Columbus Day Holiday – College Closed 

  26 DACC Board of Trustees Meeting, 5:30 p.m., Hoopeston Higher Learning Center 

13. Adjournment 



 
 
    BOARD AGENDA ITEM 6 
 
 
 
 
 
  

 
Liberal Arts and Library Services Report 



 
 
    BOARD AGENDA ITEM 7 
 
 
 
 
 
  

 
President’s Report 



 
 
    BOARD AGENDA ITEM 8 
 
 
 
 
 
  

 
Public Comment 



 CONSENT AGENDA ITEM 9A    
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Board Consideration of the Minutes of the  
Regular Board Meeting of June 22, 2017 



MINUTES OF THE REGULAR MEETING of June 22, 2017 
On June 22, 2017, the Board of Trustees of Community College District 507, in the 
Counties of Vermilion, Edgar, Iroquois, Champaign, and Ford in the State of Illinois, met in 
regular session in the Board Room, Vermilion Hall, Room 302 at Danville Area 
Community College.   
 
ITEM 1: CALL TO ORDER 
Chairman Dave Harby called the meeting to order at 5:30 p.m. 
 
ITEM 2: PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE 
Ms. Sadie Edwards led the Board and those in attendance in reciting the Pledge of 
Allegiance to the Flag.     
 
ITEM 3: ROLL CALL 
The roll was called.  Trustees present:  Bill Black, Dave Harby, Terry Hill, Tonya Hill, Dr. 
Ron Serfoss, John Spezia, Greg Wolfe, and Student Trustee Sadie Edwards.       
 
Others present:  President Dr. Stephen Nacco, Board Secretary Kerri Thurman, Dave 
Kietzmann, Tammy Clark-Betancourt, Jill Cranmore, Mike Cunningham, Lara Conklin, 
Jerry Davis, Bruce Rape, Laura Hensgen, Darrin Haynes, Lisa Osborne, Amanda Krabbe, 
Wendy Brown, Nancy Schutt, Matt Nail, Reece Niccum, Ian Clemmons, and Corey Potter.                            
 
Media present:  None.    
 
ITEM 4: ADOPTION OF AGENDA 
Mr. Harby asked if there were any changes requested to the agenda.  With no changes 
requested, upon motion by Mr. Wolfe, and a second by Mr. Black, the agenda was 
approved as presented.  The motion passed by unanimous voice vote:  8 yeas, 0 nays.   
 
ITEM 5: RECOGNITION OF VISITORS 
Dr. Nacco introduced the following members of the Administrative Council:  Dave 
Kietzmann, Vice President of Instruction and Student Services; Tammy Clark-Betancourt, 
Chief Financial Officer; Mike Cunningham, Director, Administrative Services; Jill 
Cranmore, Director, Human Resources; and Lara Conklin, Director, Marketing and College 
Relations.  Also present:  Jerry Davis, Davis and Delanois; Bruce Rape, Dean, Business and 
Technology; Laura Hensgen, Coordinator, Continuing Education; Darrin Haynes, Building 
Services and Classified Union President; Lisa Osborne, Administrative Assistant, Business 
and Technology; Amanda Krabbe, Instructor, Horticulture; Wendy Brown, Professor, 
Microbiology; Nancy Schutt, Student; First Gig Mentors Matt Nail, Reece Niccum, and Ian 
Clemmons; and Corey Potter, ONI Risk Partners. 
 
Media present:  None.   
 
ITEM 6: PRESENTATION FROM FIRST GIG ROCK CAMP PARTICIPANTS 
Ms. Laura Hensgen gave an update on the First Gig Rock Camp.  This year, there are 5 
bands with 36 musicians in total.  The first year there were 2 bands.  She introduced Matt 
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Nail, Reece Niccum, and Ian Clemmons who were part of the first camp six years ago and 
have returned as camp mentors this year.  As a result of the camp, the young men have kept 
in contact and have formed their own band.  They have written and recorded an album and 
are currently working on their next album.  A portion of the group’s music video featuring 
the Fischer Theater was shared.  Each musician shared his experience with the camp and 
how participating in the camp influenced each of their musical careers.  The bands 
participating in the camp will perform at the Dick Van Dyke Auditorium on Saturday at 
1:00 p.m.   
 
The Board and Dr. Nacco thanked Ms. Hensgen for her leadership with the camp and the 
musicians for sharing their stories.   
 
ITEM 7: BUSINESS AND TECHNOLOGY REPORT 
Mr. Bruce Rape presented his annual Business and Technology report to the Board.  Mr. 
Rape reported his department has focused on revitalization, rigor and relevance, and re-
invention.  With an emphasis on the upcoming HLC visit, courses are being reviewed and 
curriculum is being updated. 
 
Mr. Rape noted the Daisy Lane farm project is a collaborative effort.  He thanked Dr. 
Wendy Brown, Ms. Amanda Krabbe, and Ms. Tammy Clark-Betancourt as well as all of 
the students and volunteers who have worked to make the project successful. 
 
Ms. Krabbe wrote and received a grant for $1,000 for use at the farm.  She encouraged 
everyone to visit the farm.  Dr. Brown shared several pictures of the farm.  There are many 
types of plants at the farm as well as bluebird boxes, owl boxes, and bee hives. 
 
Ms. Nancy Schutt, student volunteer at the farm, shared her experience at DACC as a 
student as well as her experience gained from being a part of the sustainability garden. 
 
The Board and Dr. Nacco thanked everyone involved for making the farm project a great 
success. 
 
ITEM 8: REPORT ON ICCTA ANNUAL CONVENTION AND AWARDS  
  BANQUET, JUNE 2, 2017 
Mr. Wolfe, Mr. Harby, Mr. Hill, and Dr. Nacco attended the ICCTA Annual Convention on 
June 2, 2017.  Mr. Craig Potter, Mr. Ryan White, and Mr. Cheney were recognized at the 
event.  Mr. Hill and Mr. Harby attended the training sessions on Friday for their mandated 
training requirements as newly elected trustees. 
 
ITEM 9: PRESIDENT’S REPORT 
Dr. Nacco shared the DACC Flash with the Board and highlighted the events from the 
month since the last meeting.     
 
ITEM 10: CLOSED SESSION FOR DELIBERATIONS CONCERNING  
  COLLECTIVE NEGOTIATING MATTERS; DELIBERATIONS  
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  CONCERNING SALARY SCHEDULES FOR ONE OR MORE  
  CLASSES OF EMPLOYEES; AND APPROVAL OF THE WRITTEN  
  CLOSED SESSION MINUTES OF MAY 23, 2017     
Upon motion by Mr. Wolfe, and a second by Mr. Hill, the following Resolution was 
adopted by roll call vote:  8 yeas, 0 nays. 
 
BE IT RESOLVED, in accordance with the provisions of Chapter 120/2(c)(2 and 21) of 
the Open Meetings Act, the Board of Trustees of Community College District #507 shall 
enter a Closed Session for deliberations concerning collective negotiating matters; 
deliberations concerning salary schedules for one or more classes of employees; and 
approval of the Written Closed Session Minutes of May 23, 2017. 
 
The Board went into Closed Session at 6:30 p.m. 
 
OPEN SESSION 
 
The Board returned to Open Session at 7:10 p.m. 
 
ITEM 11: PUBLIC COMMENT 
There was no public comment.         
 
ITEM 12: CONSENT AGENDA 

A. BOARD CONSIDERATION OF THE MINUTES OF THE 
REGULAR BOARD MEETING OF MAY 23, 2017 

B. FINANCIAL REPORT 
C. HUMAN RESOURCES REPORT 
D. BOARD CONSIDERATION OF BOARD POLICY REVISION 

1. BOARD POLICY #6013 – PURCHASING 
Upon motion by Mr. Black, and a second by Mrs. Hill, the items on the Consent Agenda 
were approved.  The motion passed by roll call vote:  8 yeas, 0 nays.    
 
ITEM 13: UNFINISHED BUSINESS 
 
ITEM 14: NEW BUSINESS 

A. BOARD CONSIDERATION OF RECOMMENDATION TO 
RATIFY COLLECTIVE BARGAINING AGREEMENT 
BETWEEN THE BOARD OF TRUSTEES AND THE 
CLASSIFIED STAFF ASSOCIATION, IEA-NEA FOR JULY 1, 
2017 THROUGH JUNE 30, 2020 

Upon motion by Dr. Serfoss, and a second by Mr. Hill, the Board ratified the Collective 
Bargaining Agreement between the Board of Trustees and the Classified Staff Association, 
IEA-NEA for July 1, 2017 through June 30, 2020.  The motion passed by roll call vote:  8 
yeas, 0 nays. 
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B. BOARD CONSIDERATION OF FY-2019 ICCB RESOURCE 
ALLOCATION AND MANAGEMENT PLAN (RAMP) 

The Illinois Community College Board (ICCB) requires the Board of Trustees to approve 
the RAMP report prior to the deadline submission of July 1, 2017.  The Capital 
Development Board (CDB) has requested that all state funded project requests include 
“green”/LEED (Leadership in Energy and Environmental Design) costs in the estimated 
project. 
 
The DACC Campus Master Plan priority project list provides an annual update of the 
estimated project costs, funding information, and revenues as of May 2017.  The estimated 
cost of projects includes 6% LEED costs and the CDB approved 2.2% inflation factor. 
 
A summary of the FY-2019 RAMP list includes:  Clock Tower Center Remodeling and 
Addition, Ornamental Horticulture Rehabilitation, Campus Storage Facility, and Parking 
Lot Repair – Tillman Avenue and Baumgart Street. 
 
Upon motion by Mr. Wolfe, and a second by Mrs. Hill, the Board approved the FY-2019 
RAMP Report which includes the above listed projects for submission to the Illinois 
Community College Board.  The motion passed by roll call vote:  8 yeas, 0 nays. 
 

C. BOARD CONSIDERATION OF RESOLUTION ASCERTAINING 
PREVAILING WAGES 

The State requires public bodies that expend government funds to annually pass a 
resolution regarding prevailing wages for designated workers employed in public works. 
 
Upon motion by Dr. Serfoss, and a second by Mr. Spezia, the Board approved the 
Resolution ascertaining prevailing wage rates.  The motion passed by roll call vote:  8 yeas, 
0 nays. 
 

D. BOARD CONSIDERATION OF PROPERTY/LIABILITY 
INSURANCE FOR FY-2018 

On behalf of DACC, ONI Risk Partners submitted for quotation to Wright Specialty 
Insurance (WRM), Uniondale, NY; Illinois Counties Risk Management Trust (ICRMT), St. 
Charles, IL; Travelers Insurance Co., Indianapolis, IN; Cincinnati Insurance Co., Fairfield, 
OH; Liberty Mutual Insurance, Indianapolis, IN; and Education Insurance Services, 
Bethesda, MD.  All except WRM and ICRMT declined to quote for various reasons. 
 
The insurance proposal prepared by Corey Potter of ONI Risk Partners reflects our 
recommendation to change from Wright Specialty Insurance to Illinois Counties Risk 
Management Trust (ICRMT).  If we change to ICRMT, our total annual premium for FY-
18 will be $137,380.00 compared to WRM’s proposal of $155,677.00.  Last year’s 
premium with WRM was $154,816.00.  It should be noted that the proposed change to 
ICRMT reflects changes in the deductibles, with the most significant being our property 
deductible increasing from $5,000.00 to $10,000.00.  It should also be noted that in the 
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previous six years we only had one claim that would have been affected by this increase in 
deductibles. 
 
In addition to their lower premium, ICRMT will also conduct a full appraisal of the DACC 
campus at no cost.  Our last appraisal was completed in October of 2010. 
 
Upon motion by Dr. Serfoss, and a second by Mrs. Hill, the Board approved changing the 
insurance provider to Illinois Counties Risk Management Trust (ICRMT) with a premium 
in the amount of $137,380.00 for property and liability insurance for FY-2018.  The motion 
passed by roll call vote:  8 yeas, 0 nays. 
 

E. BOARD CONSIDERATION OF FY18 CAPITAL EQUIPMENT 
LIST 

The list of recommended Capital Equipment items as submitted by budget supervisors was 
reviewed, adjusted, and approved by the Capital Equipment Committee.  The amounts are 
estimated by the person making the requests and may vary with a similar item.  Bid items 
over $25,000 will be presented to the Board for approval. 
 
Approval of the list is being requested at this time so the items may be bid or quoted, 
approved by the Board if bid, ordered, and delivered as soon as possible after July 1 so 
items can be installed in time for the start of the fall semester. 
 
The funding support of $1,011,600 in equipment is possible as a result of $323,400 in 
Tech/Equipment bond proceeds, $383,000 in 1994 referendum funds, $128,800 in grant and 
special revenue funds, and $176,400 from Capital Equipment Replacement Reserves. 
 
Upon motion by Mr. Black, and a second by Dr. Serfoss, the Board approved the FY18 
Capital Equipment list.  The motion passed by roll call vote:  8 yeas, 0 nays. 
 

F. BOARD CONSIDERATION OF NEW BOARD POLICY 
1. BOARD POLICY #4061 – FRAUD AWARENESS AND 

WHISTLEBLOWER POLICY 
The proposed policy encourages members of the College community to report or disclose 
allegations of internal wrongdoing and provides both an internal and external mechanism 
for that reporting.  The policy also incorporates the requirements of the Illinois 
Whistleblower Act, 740 ILCS 174/1 et. seq. which prohibits retaliation against a 
whistleblower.  In addition, the policy strengthens our internal controls as outlined by the 
State of Illinois Grant Accountability and Transparency Act (GATA). 
 
Upon motion by Mr. Black, and a second by Mr. Hill, the Board approved Board Policy 
#4061 – Fraud Awareness and Whistleblower Policy.  The motion passed by roll call vote:  
8 yeas, 0 nays. 
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ITEM 15: INFORMATION 

A. COMMUNICATIONS 
 Letters of appreciation from Mrs. Miller and Mr. Mervis for honoring 

them as honorary degree recipients at Commencement.   
 
ITEM 16: ADJOURNMENT 
There being no further business to discuss, Mr. Harby adjourned the meeting at 7:30 p.m.        
 
 
 
     __________________________________________ 
     Chairperson, Board of Trustees 
 
 
     __________________________________________ 
     Secretary, Board of Trustees 
 
 
 
Approved:  __________________________________  
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FINANCIAL REPORT 
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Human Resources Report 

July 20, 2017 
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Human Resources 
 
(Recommendations of Employment are conditional upon all Human Resources 
processes being met.) 

 
1. New Employees 
  
 (Full-time Classified Employment Contract) 

 
Ovall, Laura – Teaching Associate, Child Development Center 
Effective Date: August 7, 2017 through June 30, 2018 
Rate of Pay: $30,784.00 annually 

 
(Full-time Probationary Faculty Employment Contract) 

 
 Childers, Shannon– Nursing Instructor, Math/Science and Health Professions 
 Effective Date:  August 15, 2017 through June 30, 2018 
 Rate of Pay:  $ 64,000.00 annually 
 

(2nd position)– Nursing Instructor, Math/Science and Health Professions 
 Effective Date:  August 15, 2017 through June 30, 2018 
 Rate of Pay:  $ 64,000.00 annually 
 
 (Notice of Temporary Employment Contract) 

  
 Cornell, Christine – CQI Secretary, CQI 
 Effective Date:  July 1, 2017 through June 30, 2018 
 Rate of Pay: $1,425.00 annually 
 
 Hantz, Kathleen – Part-time Librarian, Library 

Effective Date:  July 1, 2017 through June 30, 2018 
 Rate of Pay: $35.71 per hour 
 
 Horlander, Ken- Disability Services, Student Success Center 
 Effective Date:  July 1, 2017 through June 30, 2018 
 Rate of Pay: $$18.17 per hour 
 
 Lopez-Cervantes, Kelley – Assistant Women’s Softball Coach, Athletics 
 Effective Date: July 1, 2017 through June 30, 2018 
 Rate of Pay: $6,240.00 annually 
 
 Ingargiola, Janet – Financial Director, Lakeview College 
 Effective Date:  July 1, 2017 through June 30, 2018 
 Rate of Pay: $5,500.00 annually 
 
 



 Kelly, Stephanie – Substitute Teaching Associate, Child Development Center 
 Effective Date: July 1, 2017 through June 30, 2018 
 Rate of Pay: $14.80 per hour 
 
 Leary, Kathy – Middle College Coordinator, Middle College 
 Effective Date: July 1, 2017 through June 30, 2018 
 Rate of Pay: $25.00 per hour 
 
 Ohl, Hannah – Women’s Assistant Basketball Coach, Athletics 
 Effective Date:  July 1, 2017 through June 30, 2018 
 Rate of Pay: $6,700.00 annually 
 
 Osborne, Lisa – Coordinator, Perkins Grant Administrator 
 Effective Date:  July 1, 2017 through June 30, 2018 
 Rate of Pay: $5,000.00 annually 
 
 Scruggs Jr., Jimmy – Middle College Credit Recovery 
 Effective Date: July 1, 2017 through June 30, 2018 
 Rate of Pay:  $15.00 per hour 
 

Dreher, Sandra – Secretary, Foundation Board 
 Effective Date: July 1, 2017 through June 30, 2018 
 Rate of Pay:  $1,530.00 annually 
 
 Voyles, Rick – Assistant Men’s Basketball Coach, Athletics 
 Effective Date:  July 1, 2017 through June 30, 2018 
 Rate of Pay: $6,700.00 annually 
 
     2. Student Workers and Work Study Students 

 
(Notice of Temporary Employment Contract) 
 
Delay, Ashley – Student Employee, Child Development Center 
Effective Date: July 1, 2017 through June 30, 2018 
Rate of Pay: $8.25 per hour 
 
Edwards, Sadie – Student Employee, Assessment Center 
Effective Date: July 1, 2017 through June 30, 2018 
Rate of Pay: $8.25 per hour 
 
Jennings, Jesse – Student Employee, Library 
Effective Date: July 1, 2017 through June 30, 2018 
Rate of Pay: $8.25 per hour 
 
Kime, Alexis – Student Employee, Business & Technology 
Effective Date: July 1, 2017 through June 30, 2018 
Rate of Pay: $8.25 per hour 
 
 



Kasunka, Choudelle – Student Employee, Library 
Effective Date: July 1, 2017 through June 30, 2018 
Rate of Pay: $8.25 per hour 
 
Lance, Brianna – Student Employee, Child Development Center 
Effective Date: July 3, 2017 through June 30, 2018 
Rate of Pay: $8.25 per hour 
 
Maruna, April - Student Employee, Adult Education 
Effective Date: July 1, 2017 through June 30, 2018 
Rate of Pay: $8.25 per hour 
 
Pryle, Holly – Student Employee, Admissions & Records 
Effective Date: June 22, 2017 through June 30, 2017 
Rate of Pay: $8.25 per hour 
 
Pryle, Holly – Student Employee, Admissions & Records 
Effective Date: July 1, 2017 through June 30, 2018 
Rate of Pay: $8.25 per hour 
 
Techtow, McKenna – Student Employee, Library 
Effective Date: July 1, 2017 through June 30, 2018 
Rate of Pay: $8.25 per hour 
 

3.  Transfer 
 
(Full-time Confidential Classified Staff Employment Contract) 

 
Doss, Rebecca – Administrative Assistant, Executive Vice President of Instruction & 
Student Services 
Effective Date:  July 31, 2017 through June 30, 2018 
Rate of Pay:  $33,644.00 annually 
 
Jett, Jonathan – Director, Vermilion County Works 
Effective Date: July 24, 2017 through June 30, 2018 
Rate of Pay: $56,700.00 annually 
 

4.  Equity Adjustment 
 

Boyd, Carla – Director, Career & Employment Services/Chief Diversity Officer 
$61,970.74 annually 
 
Thurman, Kerri – Executive Assistant to the President/Secretary to the 
Board/Director of Grants - $57,205.00 annually  
 

     5. Title Change 
 

Conklin, Lara – Director, Marketing & College Relations to Executive Director of 
College Relations 



  
     6. Resignation 
 
 McCoy, Erin – Nursing Instructor, Math/Science & Health Professions 
 Effective Date:  July 11, 2017 
 
     7. Part-time and Additional Instructor Salaries, Summer Semester 2017 
 
     8. Authorization for Employment 
 
 

AUTHORIZATION FOR EMPLOYMENT  
July 20, 2017 

Name Position 
Beginning 

Date 
Ending 

Date 

Scheduled 
No. of Hours 

* 
Wage 

Donaldson, 
Nathan 

Liberal Arts 9/5/17 6/30/18 10-15 $18.17/hr. 

Jarmer, 
Marla 

Liberal Arts 9/5/17 6/30/18 13-20 $21.80/hr. 

Ramloff, 
Carol 

TRIO 
Professional 
Tutor 

7/5/17 7/26/17 15  $18.17/hr. 

Thompson, 
Alan 

MASS Tutor 7/1/17 6/30/18 10 $18.17/hr. 

Thompson, 
Tracy 

MASS 
Coordinator 

7/1/17 6/30/18 20 $21.80/hr. 



AUTHORIZATION FOR EMPLOYMENT  
July 20, 2017 

Name Position 
Beginning 

Date 
Ending 

Date 

Scheduled 
No. of Hours 

* 
Wage 

Adams, 
Brenda 

Fitness Center 
Assistant 

7/1/2017 6/30/2018 10-20 $16.55/hr. 

Allen, Nancy Fitness Center 
Assistant 

7/1/2017 6/30/2018 10-20 $16.55/hr. 

Carter, 
Nicole 

MASS 
Professional 
Tutor 

8/2/2017 6/30/2018 10 $18.17/hr. 

Dailey, Paula MASS 
Professional 
Tutor 

8/8/2017 6/30/2018 15 $18.17/hr. 

Davis, Aline MASS 
Professional 
Tutor 

8/7/2017 6/30/2018 6 $18.17/hr. 

Dryer, Kylie Director, 
Fitness Center 

7/1/2017 6/30/2018 18-25 $19.73/hr. 

Hardwidge, 
Mark 

MASS 
Professional 
Tutor 

8/4/2017 6/30/2018 10 $18.17/hr. 

Johnson, 
Erica 

MASS 
Professional 
Tutor 

8/6/2017 6/30/2018 6 $18.17/hr. 

Larson, 
Marji 

MASS 
Professional 
Tutor 

8/3/2017 6/30/2018 10 $18.17/hr. 

Mills, Linda Fitness Center 
Assistant 

7/1/2017 6/30/2018 10-20 $16.55/hr. 

Oglesby, Stan MASS 
Professional 
Tutor 

8/5/2017 6/30/2018 10 $18.17/hr. 

Ohl, Hannah Fitness Center 
Assistant 

7/1/2017 6/30/2018 10-20 $16.55/hr. 

Parker, 
Kortney 

Fitness Center 
Assistant 

7/1/2017 6/30/2018 10-20 $16.55/hr. 

ZuHone, 
Pam 

Fitness Center 
Assistant 

7/1/2017 6/30/2018 10-20 $16.55/hr. 
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Board Consideration of Board Policy Revision 

1.   Board Policy #4052 – Sick Leave and Personal Business 
Leave 

  
 
  
 
 
 
 
  
 
 



AGENDA ITEM:  9D 
 
AGENDA TITLE: BOARD CONSIDERATION OF BOARD POLICY REVISION 

1. Board Policy #4052 – Sick Leave and Personal Business Leave 
 
DATE:   July 20, 2017 
 
RESOURCE:  Stephen Nacco 
 
SUBMITTED FOR: ACTION 
 
SUMMARY: 1. Board Policy #4052 – Sick Leave and Personal Business Leave 
 

The proposed revision revises the number of personal business leave days 
that an employee is allowed to accumulate.  Currently, both union contracts 
state that an employee can accumulate up to 12 days; however, the Board 
policy indicates 10 days.  So that all employees are the same, we are 
proposing to change the Board policy to 12 days versus 10.       

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
RECOMMENDATION:   May we ask the Board to approve the revision of Board Policy #4052 

– Sick Leave and Personal Business Leave. 



 
 
Board Policies and Procedures Manual  

 

Index | Section 4000 – Human Resources 

Sick Leave and Personal Business Leave  4052 
 
Full-time employees will be granted sick leave with full pay for personal illness or injury based upon 
the number of weeks employed per year in accordance with the Sick Leave Schedule below.  

Approval may be granted for an employee to use sick leave in order to assist members of the 
immediate family who have a serious illness. Immediate family shall mean spouse, children, parents, 
brothers or sisters. 

Employees must report the use of sick leave before work assignments begin. 

The maximum accumulation of sick leave is 300 days. Employees may use the maximum number of 
sick leave days. However, an employee may not receive sick leave pay for days the employee was not 
scheduled to work. 

An employee must contact the Human Resources Department following three (3) consecutive days of 
absence due to illness or injury of an employee or family member. A licensed physician's statement, or 
if treatment is by prayer or spiritual means, that of a spiritual advisor or practitioner of such employee's 
faith, may be required as a basis for pay during leave after three (3) consecutive days of personal or 
immediate family illness or as deemed necessary by the Board in other cases. 

Part-time employees shall have sick leave in accordance with the Part Time Sick Leave Schedule. 

Procedure 

Supervisory approval may be granted in one of two ways: 

1. Employee completing and supervisor approving written Request for Leave/Report of Absence 
form. 

2. In the event of an emergency, employee contacting supervisor directly and receiving verbal 
supervisory approval and completing the written Request for Leave/Report of Absence form 
upon return to work.  

Sick leave may not be taken in increments of less than one hour for classified staff and in increments 
of less than one-half day for administrative staff. 

 

 



Personal Business Leave 

In accordance with the Full-Time and Part-Time Sick Leave Schedules below, full-time and part-time 
employees may be granted personal business days for personal business that cannot be scheduled 
during an employee's non-working time.  

Employees must obtain supervisory approval prior to the use of personal business leave and before 
work assignments begin. 

Personal business leave shall not be granted for a duty day immediately before or after any other 
vacations or holidays. A supervisor may limit an employee's personal business leave if the supervisor 
receives more than one request for the same day. Personal business leave may not interfere with 
scheduled College functions. 

Personal business days are only to be used to attend personal business which cannot be handled during 
non-work time. Personal business days are not to be considered additional days for recreation or 
vacation. Any or all employees who abuse this policy are subject to appropriate disciplinary action. 

Unused Personal Business may accumulate to 10 12 personal days maximum. An employee may not 
receive personal business leave pay for days the employee was not scheduled to work.  Personal 
Business leave must be limited to no more than 3 consecutive days.  However, exceptions may be 
granted by the Director of Human Resources upon receipt of appropriate justification. 

Procedure 

Supervisory approval may be granted in one of two ways: 

1. Employee completing and supervisor approving written request for leave. 
2. Employee contacting and receiving verbal supervisory approval and completing written 

Request for Leave/Report of Absence form. 

Personal business leave may not be taken in increments of less than one hour for classified staff and 
less than one-half day for administrative staff. 

Full-Time Sick Leave and Personal Business Leave Schedule 

Weeks 
Sick 
Leave: 

Personal Business:  

32  7 days 3.0 days 

33 7 days 3.0 days 

34 8 days 3.0 days  

35 8 days 3.0 days  

36 8 days 3.0 days  

37 8 days 3.0 days  

38 9 days 3.0 days  

39 9 days 3.0 days  



40 10 days 3.0 days  

41 10 days 3.0 days  

42 10 days 3.0 days  

43  10 days 3.0 days  

44  10 days 3.0 days  

45  11 days 3.0 days  

46  11 days 3.0 days  

47  12 days 3.0 days  

48  12 days 3.0 days  

49  12 days 3.0 days  

50  12 days 3.0 days  

51  13 days 3.0 days  

52  13 days 3.0 days  

Based on 4.3 weeks per month 

The sick leave days listed on the previous page include the personal business days noted. Full-time 
regularly employed teaching faculty are entitled to twelve (12) sick leave days each academic year, per 
Collective Bargaining Agreement. 

Once an employee has used the maximum number of sick leave or personal business leave days 
allowed per school term, no additional sick leave or personal business leave may be used until the 
employee returns to active duty in a succeeding school term. 

Part-Time Sick Leave and Personal Business Schedule 

Weeks 
Sick 
Leave: 

Personal Business:

(20-29 hours 
a week)   

39 or less 5 days 1 day 

40-44 5 days 1 day 

45-51 5.5 days 1.5 days 

52 6.5 days 1.5 days 

(30-39 hours 
a week)    

39 or less  7.5 days 1.5 days 

40-44  7.5 days 1.5 days 

45-51  8 days 2.0 days 

52  10 days 2.0 days 
 
 
 



Procedure 

Supervisory approval may be granted in one of two ways: 

1. Employee completing and supervisor approving written Request for Leave/Report of Absence 
form. 

2. In the event of an emergency, employee contacting supervisor directly and receiving verbal 
supervisory approval and completing the written Request for Leave/Report of Absence form 
upon return to work.  

 
Adopted: 7-28-92; Revised: 3-23-93; Revised:  11-8-93; Revised:  11-24-98; Revised:  1-28-03; 
Revised:  1-26-10; Revised:  12-20-11; Revised:  4-22-14; Revised:  7-20-17 
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Board Consideration of Approval of  

Travel Expenditures for Trustees 
 
 

 
  

     
 
 
  
 
  
 
 
 
 
  
 
 



AGENDA ITEM: 11A 
 
AGENDA TITLE: BOARD CONSIDERATION OF APPROVAL OF TRAVEL 

EXPENDITURES FOR TRUSTEES 
 
MEETING DATE: July 20, 2017 
 
RESOURCE: Dr. Stephen Nacco 
     
SUBMITTED FOR: APPROVAL 
 
SUMMARY: Per Public Law 99-0604, known as the “Local Government Travel 

Expense Control Act,” travel expenses for members of the Board of 
Trustees must be approved at an open meeting of the Board.   

 
A total of $1,194.32 was expended for the ICCTA Annual Convention in 
Normal, Illinois on June 2-3, 2017 for Mr. Dave Harby, Mr. Terry Hill, 
Mr. Greg Wolfe, and Mr. Dick Cheney.  It should be noted that $480.00 of 
the total was mandated training for newly elected trustees (Mr. Harby and 
Mr. Hill).     
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
ACTION: May we ask the Board to approve the travel expenses as listed above.       
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Permit Interfund Loans as Needed for the  
Period of August 2017 Through July 2018 

 
 

 
  

     
 
 
  
 
  
 
 
 
 
  
 
 



AGENDA ITEM: 11B 
 
AGENDA TITLE:      BOARD CONSIDERATION OF AUTHORIZATION TO 
                                    PERMIT INTERFUND LOANS AS NEEDED FOR THE 
  PERIOD OF AUGUST 2017 THROUGH JULY 2018 
                                                                       
DATE:                        July 20, 2017 
 
RESOURCE:              Tammy Clark-Betancourt 
 
SUBMITTED FOR:   Action 
 
SUMMARY:              Due to the continued delay in processing payments by the State of  
  Illinois, as well as reduced funding from the state, several of the 
 College’s Funds are continuing to experience a negative cash balance 
 at various times during the year.  In addition, most of our grants are on 
 a reimbursable basis.  We incur the cost and then periodically, based  
 on the grant regulations, request reimbursement for these expenditures,  
 which has a negative affect on cash flow.   
  
 Interfund loans do not change the College’s total cash balance, but the 
                                    transaction does provide for each individual Fund to reflect a positive 
                                    cash balance.  This request will provide lending options through the  
  FY18 fiscal year end and address the anticipated negative cash balance 
  during the next year.   
  
 The current authorization for interfund loans ends on July 31, 2017.   
  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
ACTION May we ask the Board to approve the authorization to permit 
REQUESTED: interfund loans as needed for the period of August 2017 through 
   July 2018.   
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AGENDA ITEM: 11C 
 
AGENDA TITLE: BOARD CONSIDERATION TO ACQUIRE PROPERTY LOCATED AT 18 

TILLMAN AVE., DANVILLE, IL 
 
RESOURCE:  Dr. Stephen Nacco, Mike Cunningham  
 
MEETING DATE: July 20, 2017 
 
SUBMITTED FOR: ACTION 
 
SUMMARY: Danville Area Community College has the opportunity to purchase property in 

the vicinity of the Mary Miller Center.  This property consists of two lots and is 
located at 18 Tillman Ave., north of the Mary Miller Center.  The owners have 
executed an option for the College to purchase.  Pending a Phase I 
Environmental Study, the purchase price for this property would be $20,000.00. 

 
 The Illinois Community College Board no longer requires ICCB approval to 

purchase property using local funds.  Attached is a Resolution to Purchase 
Property.  Facility Construction Equipment and Renovation Reserve Funds will 
be used for this project. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
ACTION 
REQUESTED: May we ask the Board to consider purchasing the property located at 18 Tillman 

Ave. for the sum of $20,000.00 pending results of a Phase I Environmental 
Study.  

 
 



 
RESOLUTION TO PURCHASE PROPERTY 

 
WHEREAS, Community College District No. 507, Counties of Vermilion, Edgar, Iroquois, 
Champaign, and Ford, State of Illinois, desires to acquire property located at 18 Tillman Ave., 
Danville, Illinois.  This property is located on Lots 28 & 29 of the Baumgart First Addition, and 
commonly known as 18 Tillman Ave., Danville, Illinois. 
   
WHEREAS, the owners have executed a Real Estate Option Agreement on this property and a Phase I 
Environmental Study will be conducted. 

 
WHEREAS, Danville Area Community College will purchase property located at 18 Tillman Ave., 
Danville, IL for the sum of $20,000.00, and assume full responsibility for all costs associated with 
ownership pending results of the Phase I Environmental Study.   

 
NOW, be resolved by the Board of Trustees of Danville Area Community College District #507, as 
follows: 
 

1. Danville Area Community College assumes ownership of the property set forth above. 
 

2. Danville Area Community College agrees to pay all related expenses and accept full 
responsibility for all future costs associated with this property. 

 
3. The Board of Trustees hereby approves and accepts ownership of said property located at 18 

Tillman Ave., Danville, IL. 
 
 
 
 

CERTIFICATE OF SECRETARY OF BOARD 
 
I do hereby certify that I am the duly elected, or appointed, qualified, and acting Secretary of the Board 
of Trustees of Community College District No. 507, Counties of Vermilion, Edgar, Iroquois, 
Champaign, and Ford, State of Illinois, and as such, I do hereby certify that the foregoing is a full, true, 
and correct copy of a resolution passed and adopted by the said Board at a meeting hereof, at which a 
lawful quorum was present, on the 20th day of July, 2017 all of which appears from the original records 
and files of said Board in my care, custody, and control. 
 
In witness whereof, I have hereunto affixed my hand and seal this 20th day of July, 2017. 

 
 

 __________________________________ 
Secretary of Said Board 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 

Home, Baumgart, and Tillman Neighborhood 
 

 
 

= Property owned by DACC 
 
 
 

= Property available to DACC 
 

 

18 Tillman Ave.
Property 
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AGENDA ITEM:  11D 
 
AGENDA TITLE: BOARD CONSIDERATION FOR INTERCOLLEGIATE SPORTS 

ACCIDENT INSURANCE FOR FY-2018 
 
DATE:   July 20, 2017 
 
RESOURCE: Mike Cunningham 
 
SUBMITTED FOR: ACTION 
 
SUMMARY: First Agency, Inc. of Kalamazoo, MI has been our supplemental 

intercollegiate athletic insurance carrier for 39 years.  This coverage is 
supplemental to an athlete’s primary carrier.  First Agency provides 
coverage to 70 universities and colleges in the state of Illinois, as well as 
colleges and universities in Indiana, Iowa, Kansas, Kentucky, Michigan, 
Alabama, and Arizona.   

 
Because of the continued reduction in claims filed, our total premium has 
dropped from $21,842.00 last year to $19,658.00 for 2017-2018.  Our 
premiums for intercollegiate athletic insurance have declined 62% since 
our 2004-2005 premium of $51,075.00.   
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
   
 
 
ACTION 
REQUESTED: May we ask the Board to approve $19,658.00 to First Agency, Inc. for 

Intercollegiate Sports Accident Insurance for FY-2018. 
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AGENDA ITEM: 11E 
 
AGENDA TITLE: BOARD CONSIDERATION TO LEASE TWO (2) 15-PASSENGER 

MINIBUSES. 
 
RESOURCE:  Mike Cunningham 
 
MEETING DATE: July 20, 2017 
 
SUBMITTED FOR: ACTION 
 
SUMMARY: Bids were advertised in the News Gazette (including on the internet) and 

submitted to Bus Service, Canal Winchester, OH, Courtesy Motors, Danville, 
IL, Midwest Transit Equipment, Kankakee, IL, Southern Bus & Mobility, 
Breese, IL, Central States Bus Sales, Fenton, MO, Master’s Transportation, 
Grandview, MO, and Best Bus Sales, Des Plaines, IL for leasing two (2) 
2017 15-passenger minibuses.  These 15-passenger minibuses are on the FY-
18 Capital Equipment list.   

 
 Bids were opened at 10:00 AM Tuesday July 11, 2017 with the following 

results. 
       
  $    806.00 Midwest Transit Equipment, Kankakee, IL 
  $    978.65 Central States Bus Sales, Fenton, MO 
  NO BID  Master’s Transportation, Grandview, MO 
            NO BID Best Bus Sales, Des Plaines, IL 

NO BID Bus Service, Canal Winchester, OH 
NO BID Southern Bus & Mobility, Breese, IL 

 NO BID Courtesy Motors, Danville, IL 
   

             
 These vehicles will replace two mini buses that have a lease expiring in 

November.  The cost of the expiring lease agreement is $753.00 per vehicle 
per month. The cost presented to the Board in April for two minibuses was 
also $806.00 per bus.  It was determined that a three-year replacement cycle 
for leased minibuses promotes a safe method of transportation with a lower 
risk of mechanical failure. 
   
 
 

 
 
 
ACTION: May we ask the Board to consider the low bid from Midwest Transit 

Equipment in the amount of $806.00 per month per vehicle to lease two (2) 
15-passenger minibuses. 
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AGENDA ITEM: 11F 
 
AGENDA TITLE: BOARD CONSIDERATION OF ACQUISITION OF THE CARNEGIE 

LIBRARY 
 
MEETING DATE: July 20, 2017 
 
RESOURCE: Dr. Stephen Nacco 
     
SUBMITTED FOR: APPROVAL 
 
SUMMARY: The acquisition of the Carnegie Library building will enable DACC to 

expand academic programming and student services that are currently 
provided in the Clock Tower Building.  Consistent with the College’s 
Academic Master Plan and Strategic Planning Matrix, the College intends 
to build more robust credit courseware to support the associate in fine arts 
degree and to ensure seamless articulation into bachelor’s in fine arts 
programs.   

 
To that end, the building will become the locus for classrooms and 
galleries to support the visual and performing arts and include credit 
classes in painting and acting.  In addition, the building will help advance 
student engagement, retention, and success by serving as a gallery to 
display student art, a black-box theater for improvisational and other 
dramatic performances, and as a rehearsal hall for student choirs, 
orchestras, and bands.  The underlying strategy is to leverage this new 
space to boost student enrollment in fine arts programs and to increase 
student participation in music and theatrical clubs.           
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
ACTION: May we ask the Board to approve the acquisition of the Carnegie Library.           
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AGENDA ITEM: 11G 
 
AGENDA TITLE: BOARD CONSIDERATION OF NAMING OPPORTUNITIES 
 
MEETING DATE: July 20, 2017 
 
RESOURCE: Dr. Stephen Nacco 
     
SUBMITTED FOR: APPROVAL 
 
SUMMARY: There is no greater tribute than a gift which publicly recognizes the impact 

of one individual, or one family, on an entire community.  Naming 
opportunities offer donors a way to establish a legacy of recognition, while 
providing essential resources for Danville Area Community College. 

 
 The following list of Naming Opportunities is being recommended: 
 
 Campus Buildings ...................................................................... $1,000,000 
 Gymnasium ................................................................................... $750,000 
 Theater .......................................................................................... $500,000 
 Science and Technology Laboratories .......................................... $250,000 
 Area in the Library ........................................................................ $250,000 
 Classrooms .................................................................................... $100,000 
 Landscaping Area ......................................................................... $100,000 
 Conference Rooms .......................................................................... $50,000 
 Faculty Endowed Chairs ..................................................... $10,000 and up 
 Endowed Scholarships ........................................................ $10,000 and up 
 Equipment (Based on need and cost) ................................................. Varies 
 
 

 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
ACTION: May we ask the Board to approve the above list of Naming Opportunities 

for Danville Area Community College.             
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