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Mission Statement  
 

Danville Area Community College is committed to providing 
quality, innovative, and accessible learning experiences that 
meet the life-long academic, cultural, and economic needs of 

our diverse communities and the world we share. 
 
 

Non-Discrimination Statement 
Danville Area Community College does not discriminate on the basis of race, color, national origin, sex, disability 

or age in its programs and activities.  Inquiries may be directed to Jill A. Cranmore, Vice President, Human 
Resources, Affirmative Action Officer, Title IX Coordinator, and Section 504/ADA Coordinator, Danville Area 
Community College, 2000 E. Main St., Martin Luther King Memorial Way, Danville, IL  61832-5199, 217-443-

8756, or jcranmore@dacc.edu. 

      
 



 
 
 
 
 
 
  
  

 
 
Danville Area Community College will continue to be nationally recognized leader in student 
success and an active partner in building and maintaining academic excellence and the 
economic vitality of the communities it serves. 

 
 

Core Values 

Integrity     
Trusting relationships and an ethical reputation with those we serve (students, faculty, 
employees, community, business, other educational institutions, government). 

Excellence 
Consistently achieving exceptional results that delight those we serve. 

Communication 
Positive and productive relationships and environment for those we serve. 

Adaptability 
Continuously meeting the changing needs of those we serve. 

Diversity 
Providing a safe and secure learning environment for the personal and intellectual 
growth of those we serve, preparing them to participate in an increasingly changing 
world.   
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 

Vision Statement 



BOARD OF TRUSTEES 
Community College District No. 507 

Regular Meeting 
DACC Board Room, Vermilion Hall 302 

Thursday, August 22, 2019 
5:30 p.m. 

 

 

AGENDA 

1. Call to Order 

2. Pledge of Allegiance 

3. Roll Call 

4. Adoption of Agenda 

5. Recognition of Visitors 

6. Continuing Education/College for Kids Report 

7. Liberal Arts and Library Services Report 

8. Financial Update 

9. President’s Report 

10. Public Comment 

 

12.    Unfinished Business 

13.  New Business 

 A. Board Consideration of Permanent Transfer of Earned Interest Monies from the 

Working Cash Fund to the Education Fund 

 B. Board Consideration of Approval of Travel Expenditures for Trustees 

 C. Board Consideration of Resolution to Place Tentative FY2020 Budget on          

Display and Set Date, Time, and Place of Public Hearing on September 26, 2019 

(FY2020 Tentative Budget-External Exhibit) 

 D. Board Consideration of Bids for CNC Lathe 

 E. Board Consideration for Purchase of Two Used 2015 Freightliner Cascadia          

Semi Tractors 

 F. Board Consideration of Bids for Bremer Theater Stage Lighting System   

Replacement 

 

Consent Agenda Items are considered to be routine, non-controversial matters and will be considered together and 
enacted by one motion and one roll call.  Any Trustee desiring to remove an item for separate consideration should 
so request before approval of the agenda. 
 

11. Consent Agenda  

A. Board Consideration of the Minutes of the Regular Board Meeting of                       

July 18, 2019 

B. Financial Report 

C. Human Resources Report 
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14. Information 

 A. Communications 

 

AUGUST 2019 

 29 Welcome Back Cook-Out on the Quad; 11:00 a.m.-1:00 p.m.  

SEPTEMBER 2019 

   2 Labor Day Holiday – College Closed 

   7 Employee Appreciation Cookout; American Legion; 1:00 p.m. 

          13-14 ICCTA Board of Representatives Meeting, Springfield 

 19 College Day, 9:00-11:00 a.m., Mary Miller Gym 

 20 Honors Program, Registration 10:00 a.m., Program 10:30 a.m., Mary Miller Gym  

 26 DACC Board of Trustees Meeting, 5:30 p.m., Vermilion Hall Room 302 

 29 Farm to Fork BBQ Fundraiser, 1:00-3:00 p.m., Bremer 

OCTOBER 2019 

 14 Columbus Day Holiday – College Closed 

 24 DACC Board of Trustees Meeting, 5:30 p.m., Vermilion Hall Room 302 

NOVEMBER 2019 

1 Family Science Night, 5:30-8:00 p.m., Mary Miller Gym 

 8-9 ICCTA Board of Representatives Meeting, Lisle 

 11 Veterans Day Holiday – College Closed 

 21 DACC Board of Trustees Meeting, 5:30 p.m., Hoopeston Higher Learning Center 

          28-29 Thanksgiving Holidays – College Closed 

DECEMBER 2019 

 19 DACC Board of Trustees Meeting, 5:30 p.m., Vermilion Hall Room 302 

 25 Christmas Day Holiday – College Closed 

          26-31 Holiday Break – College Closed 

15. Adjournment 
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Liberal Arts and Library Services Report 
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 CONSENT AGENDA ITEM 11A    
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Board Consideration of the Minutes of the  
Regular Board Meeting of July 18, 2019 



MINUTES OF THE REGULAR MEETING of July 18, 2019 
On July 18, 2019, the Board of Trustees of Community College District 507, in the 
Counties of Vermilion, Edgar, Iroquois, Champaign, and Ford in the State of Illinois, met in 
regular session in the Board Room, Vermilion Hall Room 302 at Danville Area Community 
College.       
 
ITEM 1: CALL TO ORDER 
Chairman Dave Harby called the meeting to order at 5:30 p.m. 
 
ITEM 2: PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE 
The Board and those in attendance recited the Pledge of Allegiance to the Flag.       
 
ITEM 3: ROLL CALL 
The roll was called.  Trustees present:  Bill Black, Tracy Cherry, Dave Harby, Terry Hill, 
Dr. Ron Serfoss, John Spezia, and Student Trustee Holley Hambleton.  Trustee absent:  
Greg Wolfe.    
 
Others present:  President Dr. Stephen Nacco, Board Secretary Kerri Thurman, Dave 
Kietzmann, Mike Cunningham, Tammy Betancourt, Jill Cranmore, Lara Conklin, Jerry 
Davis, and Terri Cummings.                                                                                                                       
 
Media present:  None.    
 
ITEM 4: ADOPTION OF AGENDA 
Mr. Harby asked if there were any changes requested to the agenda.  With no changes 
requested, upon motion by Dr. Serfoss, and a second by Mr. Hill, the agenda was approved 
as presented.  The motion passed by unanimous voice vote:  7 yeas, 0 nays.   
 
ITEM 5: RECOGNITION OF VISITORS 
Dr. Nacco introduced the following members of the Administrative Council:  Dave 
Kietzmann, Executive Vice President, Instruction and Student Services; Mike Cunningham, 
Vice President, Administrative Services; Tammy Betancourt, Vice President, Finance/Chief 
Financial Officer; Jill Cranmore, Vice President, Human Resources; and Lara Conklin, 
Executive Director, College Relations.  Also present:  Jerry Davis, Davis & Delanois; and 
Terri Cummings, Dean, Business & Technology. 
 
Media present:  None.   
 
ITEM 6: REPORT ON BUSINESS AND TECHNOLOGY 
Mrs. Terri Cummings gave a report on Business and Technology.  Ms. Cummings shared 
and highlighted an Activity Report for 2018-2019 with the Trustees.  She reported a 
tutoring center for the division was added as a result of a student survey.  Agriculture was 
transitioned to the division and a Sustainability program has been added.  The Business 
Administrative Technology curriculum has been updated and Computer Programming has 
been changed to Applied Computer Science.   
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In the Business Division, the Marketing curriculum is being brought to an on-campus, web 
hybrid format and research is being completed for revamping the program.  In the 
Technology Division, two new instructors were hired and they are currently working on a 
plan to partner with Courtesy Ford to become NATEF (National Institute for Auto Service 
Excellence) certified.  A tremendous amount of work has been completed at the Land Lab. 
 
Ms. Cummings reported the contract with the Department of Corrections has been 
reinstated.  The program has been reorganized to include Automotive Technology, 
Construction, Custodial and Career vocational programs.  Enrollment in the Tractor/Trailer 
program is flourishing and enrollment in College Express/PLTW is steady.  Ms. Cummings 
also shared a few student testimonials with the Trustees. 
 
The Board and Dr. Nacco thanked Ms. Cummings for her report and for her dedication to 
the College. 
 
ITEM 7: FINANCIAL UPDATE 
Ms. Tammy Betancourt gave a financial update to the Board.  The Financial Statement of 
Revenue and Expenditures ending June 30, 2019 was included in the Board agenda book. 
 
ITEM 8: PRESIDENT’S REPORT 
Dr. Nacco shared the DACC Flash with the Board and highlighted the events from the 
month since the last meeting.       
 
ITEM 9: PUBLIC COMMENT 
There was no public comment.             
 
ITEM 10: CONSENT AGENDA 

A. BOARD CONSIDERATION OF THE MINUTES OF THE 
REGULAR BOARD MEETING OF JUNE 27, 2019 

B. FINANCIAL REPORT 
C. HUMAN RESOURCES REPORT 

Upon motion by Mr. Hill, and a second by Mr. Black, the Board approved the items on the 
Consent Agenda.  The motion passed by roll call vote:  7 yeas, 0 nays.    
 
ITEM 11: UNFINISHED BUSINESS 
 
ITEM 12: NEW BUSINESS 

A. BOARD CONSIDERATION OF NEW BOARD POLICY - #6034 – 
DATA GOVERNANCE 

The purpose of a data governance policy is to assign and detail responsibilities for 
managing DACC student and performance data while following the mission of the College.  
The policy establishes a framework for standards and guidelines to be followed in creation 
of data access and usage. 
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Upon motion by Mr. Black, and a second by Mr. Hill, the Board approved Board Policy 
#6034 – Data Governance.  The motion passed by roll call vote:  7 yeas, 0 nays. 
 

B. BOARD CONSIDERATION OF AUTHORIZATION TO PERMIT 
INTERFOLD LOANS AS NEEDED FOR THE PERIOD OF 
AUGUST 2019 THROUGH JULY 2020 

Due to the timing of revenue and expenditure amounts that occur during the year, several of 
the College’s Funds experience a negative cash balance at various times during the year. In 
addition, most of our grants are on a reimbursable basis. We incur the cost and then 
periodically, based on the grant regulations, request reimbursement for these expenditures, 
which has a negative effect on cash flow. 
 
Interfund loans do not change the College’s total cash balance, but the transaction does 
provide for each individual Fund to reflect a positive cash balance. This request will 
provide lending options through the FY20 fiscal year and address the anticipated negative 
cash balance during the next year. The current authorization for interfund loans ends on 
July 31, 2019. 
 
Upon motion by Dr. Serfoss, and a second by Mr. Hill, the Board approved the 
authorization to permit interfund loans as needed for the period of August 2019 through 
July 2020. The motion passed by roll call vote: 7 yeas, 0 nays. 
 

C. BOARD CONSIDERATION OF APPROVAL OF TRAVEL 
EXPENDITURES FOR TRUSTEES 

Per Public Law 99-0604, known as the “Local Government Travel Expense Control Act,” 
travel expenses for members of the Board of Trustees must be approved at an open meeting 
of the Board. 
 
A total of $712.76 was expended for travel expenditures for trustees over the last month for 
expenses for the ICCTA Annual Banquet and Seminar in Itasca, Illinois on June 7-8, 2019 
for Mr. Greg Wolfe and Ms. Tracy Cherry. 
 
Upon motion by Mr. Hill, and a second by Ms. Cherry, the Board approved the travel 
expenses as listed.  The motion passed by roll call vote:  7 yeas, 0 nays. 
 
ITEM 13: INFORMATION 

A. COMMUNICATIONS 
 A letter from the ACEN granting continued accreditation to the 

Nursing Program. 
 A letter from JRCERT granting continued accreditation to the 

Radiography Program. 
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ITEM 17: ADJOURNMENT 
There being no further business to discuss, Mr. Harby adjourned the meeting at 6:25 p.m. 
       
 
     __________________________________________ 
     Chairperson, Board of Trustees 
 
 
     __________________________________________ 
     Secretary, Board of Trustees 
 
 
Approved:  __________________________________  
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Human Resources 
(Recommendations of Employment are conditional upon all Human Resources processes being met.) 
 

1. New Employees 
 
  (Notice of Full-Time Administrative Employment Contracts) 

 
Hicks, Clayton – Assistant Baseball Coach/Coordinator of Strength and Conditioning/ 
Athletic Academic Supervisor, Athletics 
Effective Date:  August 23, 2019 through June 30, 2020 
Rate of Pay:   $34,800.00 annually 
 
Rangel, Isela – Academic Advisor/Coordinator of Advisement Systems, Advisement & Counseling 
Effective Date:  August 26, 2019 through June 30, 2020 
Rate of Pay:  $36,000.00 annually 

 
 (Notice of Full-Time Probationary Faculty Contract) 
  
 Arnholt, Rachael–Sonography Instructor, Math, Science and Health Professions 
 Effective Date:  August 14, 2019 through June 30, 2020 
 Rate of Pay:  $52,000.00 annually  
 

(Notice of Full-Time Specially Funded Administrative & Professional Staff Contract) 
 
 Farrar, Nicholas – Automotive Technology Instructor, Department of Corrections 
 Effective Date:  Approximately September 15, 2019 through June 30, 2020 
 Rate of Pay:  Approximately $51,005.00 annually 
 
 (Notice of Full-Time Classified Employment Contract) 

 
Aquino, Jessica – Administrative Assistant, Advisement & Counseling 
Effective Date:  July 29, 2019 through June 30, 2020 
Rate of Pay:  $31,092.00 annually 

 
 (Notice of Temporary Employment Contract) 

 
 Acklin, Jim – Co-Head Coach, Cross Country, Athletics 
 Effective Date:  July 1, 2019 through June 30, 2020 
 Rate of Pay:  $5,640.00 annually  
 
 Cervantes, Kelly – Assistant Softball Coach, Athletics 
 Effective Date:  July 1, 2019 through June 30, 2020 
 Rate of Pay:  $6,970.00 annually 
 
 Cronk, Hannah – Assistant Women’s Basketball Coach, Athletics 
 Effective Date:  July 1, 2019 through June 30, 2020 
 Rate of Pay:  $6,970.00 annually  
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 (Notice of Temporary Employment Contract, continued) 

  
 Esteves, Michael Guido- Audio Visual Technician, Audio Visual 
 Effective Date:  August 12, 2019 through June 30, 2020 
 Rate of Pay:  $20.00 per hour 
 
 French, Terry – Head Coach, Golf, Athletics 
 Effective Date:  July 1, 2019 through June 30, 2020 
 Rate of Pay:  $6,895.00 annually 
 
 Hunter, Kathy – Director, Tutoring Center, Business & Technology 
 Effective Date:  July 1, 2019 through June 30, 2020 
 Rate of Pay: $22.68 per hour 
 
 McGlory, Nikia – Cheerleading Coach, Athletics 
 Effective Date:  July 1, 2019 through June 30, 2020 
 Rate of Pay:  $3,485.00 annually 
 
 Toler, Debbie – Head Coach, Women’s Golf, Athletics 
 Effective Date:  July 1, 2019 through June 30, 2020 
 Rate of Pay:  $6,895.00 annually 
 
 Voyles, Rick – Assistant Men’s Basketball Coach, Athletics 
 Effective Date:  July 1, 2019 through June 30, 2020 
 Rate of Pay:  $6,970.00 annually 
 
 Wheaton, Janet – Tutor, Assessment Center 
 Effective Date:  July 1, 2019 through June 30, 2020 
 Rate of Pay:  $12.65 per hour 
 
 White, Kaighla – Professional Tutor, Liberal Arts 
 Effective Date:  August 19, 2019 through June 30, 2020 
 Rate of Pay:  $18.90 per hour  
 
 Winkler, Travis – Co-Head Coach, Cross Country, Athletics 
 Effective Date:  July 1, 2019 through June 30, 2020 
 Rate of Pay:  $5,640.00 annually 
 
   2. Student Workers 

 
(Notice of Temporary Employment Contract) 
 
Caballero, Selena – Student Employee, Advisement and Counseling 
Effective Date:  August 19, 2019 through June 30, 2020 
Rate of Pay:  $8.25 per hour 
 
 
 



Board of Trustees 
August 22, 2019 
Human Resources – Page 3 

 
(Notice of Temporary Employment Contract, continued) 
 
Fuller, Sabrina – Student Employee, Culinary Arts 
Effective Date:  August 12, 2019 through June 30, 2020 
Rate of Pay:  $8.25 per hour 
 
Innes, Ellia – Student Employee, Child Development Center 
Effective Date:  July 1, 2019 through June 30, 2020 
Rate of Pay:  $10.00 per hour 
 
Johnson, Charles – Student Employee, Liberal Arts 
Effective Date:  August 9, 2019 through June 30, 2020 
Rate of Pay:  $8.25 per hour 
 
Judd, Lucas – Student Employee, Campus Services 
Effective Date:  August 1, 2019 through June 30, 2020 
Rate of Pay:  $8.25 per hour 
 
Logue, Ashlyn – Student Employee, TRIO/Student Success Center 
Effective Date:  August 19, 2019 through June 30, 2020 
Rate of Pay:  $8.25 per hour 
 
Snider, Hannah – Student Employee, Child Development Center 
Effective Date:  August 19, 2019 through June 30, 2020 
Rate of Pay:  $10.00 per hour 
 
Wheaton, Janet – Student Employee, Assessment Center 
Effective Date:  July 1, 2019 through June 30, 2020 
Rate of Pay:  $8.25 per hour 
 

3. Salary Adjustment 
 
 Dreher, Sandra – Controller/Office Manager, Foundation 
 Effective Date:  July 1, 2019 through June 30, 2020 
 Rate of Pay:  $54,000.00 annually 
 
4. Title Change and Salary Adjustment 
 
 Cornell, Christine – Marketing Specialist, Marketing and College Relations 
 (from Classified Union Employee to Confidential Classified Employee) 
 Effective Date:  September 1, 2019 through June 30, 2020 
 Rate of Pay:  $49,637.43 annually  
 
 McBride, Kellie – Career and Veteran Specialist, Career Services 
 Effective Date:  September 1, 2019 through June 30, 2020 
 Rate of Pay:  $33,637.00 annually 
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5. Resignation 
  
 Green, Melanie – Academic Advisor/Coordinator of Advisement Systems 
 Effective Date:  August 9, 2019 
 
6. Recommendation for Revised 2019-2020 Salary Adjustments for Temporary/Part-Time Staff. 
 
7. Part-time and Additional Instructor Salaries, Summer Semester 2019 
 
8. Authorization for Employment 
 
 

























TEMPORARY AND PART-TIME POSITION SALARIES - FY20
08/19/19

FY 2020
POSITION  DESCRIPTION Revised

INSTRUCTORS:
         (effective Fall '19-Summer '20)

GENERAL P/T INSTRUCTORS 
   Part-Time General $715.00 cr/hr
   Part-Time Academy Graduate $730.00 cr/hr
   Returning Retiree $730.00 cr/hr

    Substitute - Classroom Instructor $38.57 hr
    Substitute - Nursing Instructor Classroom (excl. CNA) $49.18 hr
    Substitute - Nursing Instructor Sim Lab (excl. CNA) $45.65 hr
    Substitute - Nursing Instructor Skills Lab (excl. CNA) $42.11 hr
    Tutorial/Independent Study Cr/Hr rate per student
    Internship 4 stdt=overload rate

CORRECTIONAL EDUCATION INSTRUCTORS P/T
    Part-Time General $546.53

ADULT EDUCATION INSTRUCTORS P/T
  (Grant funded - effective 7/1/19-6/30/20)
    Per credit hour rate $550.00 cr/hr
    Hourly rate $33.00 hr

COMMUNITY EDUCATION INSTRUCTORS P/T
             (per contact hour)
     Part-Time Instructor (less than 10 yrs of consecutive service to Dept.) $20.00 hr
     Part -Time Instructor (min. 10 yrs of consecutive service to Dept.) $25.00 hr

ATHLETIC STAFF:   

    Effective Dates: Start as early as July 1 through August 1
                                  End on June 30
    Head Coaches --
        Cross Country  $6,895.00
        Golf - Women's $6,895.00
        Golf - Men's $6,895.00

    Co Head Coaches --
        Cross Country  $5,640.00

     Assistant Coaches --
        Basketball - Men  $6,970.00
        Basketball - Women  $6,970.00
        Baseball $6,970.00
        Softball   $6,970.00
        Cross Country  $4,370.00

     Cheerleading/Dance Coach  (50% of Basketball Assist Coach) $3,485.00
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TEMPORARY AND PART-TIME POSITION SALARIES - FY20
08/19/19

FY 2020
POSITION  DESCRIPTION Revised

ATHLETIC SUMMER CAMP STAFF:   
     Assistant Camp Director (experience: 2 years or more) $80.00 sess
     Assistant Camp Director (experience: Less than 2 years) $70.00 sess
     DACC, 2 year or 4 year Coaches $40.00 sess
     Elementary, Jr. High , High School Coaches - After First Year $36.00 sess
     Elementary, Jr. High , High School Coaches - First Year $30.00 sess
     College Student (DACC, 2 year or 4 year) - After First Year $27.50 sess
     College Student (DACC, 2 year or 4 year) - First Year 7/1/19-12/31/19 $24.75 sess
     College Student (DACC, 2 year or 4 year) - First Year 1/1/20-6/30/20 $27.75 sess
               (Note:  session length  is 3 hours)

STIPENDS (addt'l duties for Faculty/Staff members):

     Lead Instructors $6,240.00
     CQI Staff -  Coordinator $5,720.00 **
     CQI Staff -  Secretary         $1,425.00
     Coordinator - AtD $2,400.00
     Coordinator - Phi Theta Kappa $2,400.00
     Coordinator - Success in College $2,400.00
     Coordinator - Music Ensembles $2,400.00
     Coordinator - International Students $2,400.00
     Assessment Champions $4,380.00
     HLC Accreditation Steering Co-Chairs $3,000.00
     Director - Financial Aid @ Lakeview College of Nursing                       $5,500.00
     Coordinator - Perkins Grant Administration $5,000.00
     Secretary - Foundation Board of Directors $1,530.00
     Radio Show Host $100.00 show
     TV Show Host $100.00 show
     Coordinator - General Level I $2,450.00
     Coordinator - General Level II $1,530.00

VARIOUS POSITIONS:

Student Assistance/Services Positions:
          (all positions in this category effective 7/1/19-6/30/20)

   Student Worker (Minimum Wage 7/1/19-12/31/19) $8.25 hr
   Student Worker (Minimum Wage 1/1/20-6/30/20) $9.25 hr
   CDC Student Worker (Minimum Wage 7/1/19-12/31/19) $10.00 hr

  Fitness Center Coordinator $20.52 hr
  Fitness Center Assistants $17.22 hr

  Tutors:
     Tutoring Centers -  Director/Coordinator $22.68 hr
     Peer Tutor (Minimum Wage 7/1/19-12/31/19) $8.25 hr
     Peer Tutor (Minimum Wage 1/1/20-6/30/20) $9.25 hr
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TEMPORARY AND PART-TIME POSITION SALARIES - FY20
08/19/19

FY 2020
POSITION  DESCRIPTION Revised

     Associate Degree Tutor $12.65 hr
     Professional Tutor (BS degree) $18.90 hr

  Middle College Lab Monitor $18.36 hr

  Training Specialist, Tractor Trailer Driver Program $25.55 hr
  Driver's Ed Instructor - Classroom $30.00 hr
  Driver's Ed Instructor - Behind the Wheel $25.00 hr
  Driver's Ed Instructor - Defensive Driving $30.00 hr

Positions Equating to F/T Bargaining Unit Levels: 
          (all positions in this category effective 7/1/19-6/30/20)

    Child Care Associate Substitute   Level 4 $15.25 hr
    Child Care Cook Substitute   Level 1 $13.39 hr

    Librarian Substitute
       Bachelors $35.79 hr
       Masters $37.15 hr

General Positions:
         (effective 7/1/19-6/30/20)
   Coordinator Level Services $20.00 hr
   Professional Level Services $25.00 hr
   Supervisory Level Services $35.00 hr
   Administrative Level Services $50.00 hr

** CQI Coordinator stipend will remain the same and be grandfathered until it is vacated.
          It will then be re-evaluated.
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Board Consideration of Permanent Transfer  
of Earned Interest Monies from the Working  

Cash Fund to the Education Fund 
     
 
 
  
 
  
 
 
 
 
  
 
 



AGENDA ITEM: 13A 
 
AGENDA TITLE:   BOARD CONSIDERATION OF PERMANENT TRANSFER OF 

EARNED INTEREST MONIES FROM THE WORKING CASH FUND  
TO THE EDUCATION FUND 

 
DATE:                        August 22, 2019 
 
RESOURCE:       Tammy Betancourt 
 
SUBMITTED FOR:   Action 
 
SUMMARY:             With an approved resolution by the Board of  Trustees, the law allows for 

earned interest to be permanently transferred from the Working Cash Fund 
to the Education Fund for general operations. 

                 
                 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
ACTION                     May we ask the Board to consider approval of the Resolution for the 
REQUESTED:      Permanent Transfer of Earned Interest Monies of $135,542.99 from the 

Working Cash Fund to the Education Fund. 
 
 
 



 
 RESOLUTION FOR THE PERMANENT TRANSFER OF 
 EARNED INTEREST MONIES FROM THE WORKING CASH FUND 
 TO THE EDUCATION FUND 
 

WHEREAS, Community College District No. 507, Counties of Vermilion, Edgar, Iroquois, 

Champaign and Ford, State of Illinois, has heretofore duly established a Working Cash Fund, 

pursuant to the Illinois Public Community College Act; and, 

WHEREAS, interest earned on Working Cash Fund monies may be permanently transferred 

to the Education Fund with no repayment required pursuant to Act number P.A. 85-0371 which 

became effective immediately when signed into law on September 11, 1987; and, 

WHEREAS, the purpose of this transfer from the Working Cash Fund to the Education   

Fund will be used in meeting the ordinary and necessary expenditures of the Community College 

District No. 507; and, 

WHEREAS, it is deemed necessary to permanently transfer the interest earned in the 

Working Cash Fund of one hundred thirty-five thousand five hundred forty-two dollars and 99/100 

($135,542.99) to the Education Fund to meet and defray such necessary expenses and liabilities of 

said Fund for the Fiscal Year 2019 beginning July 1, 2018 through June 30, 2019; 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, by the Board of Trustees of Community College 

District No. 507, Counties of Vermilion, Edgar, Iroquois, Champaign and Ford, State of Illinois, as 

follows: 



SECTION 1:  That the Treasurer of Community College District No. 507 be, and he/she is 

hereby, authorized and directed, for and on behalf of the District, to permanently transfer the interest 

earnings in the amount of one hundred thirty-five thousand five hundred forty-two dollars and 

99/100 ($135,542.99) from the Working Cash Fund to the Education Fund to meet and defray the 

ordinary and necessary expenses of said Fund for Fiscal Year 2019. 

SECTION 2:  That this Resolution shall be in full force and effect from and after its passage. 

PASSED this 22nd day of August, 2019, by __________ Ayes and __________ Nays, to-

wit: 

 

        Voting Aye           Voting Nay 

______________________________      _______________________________ 

______________________________      _______________________________ 

______________________________      _______________________________ 

______________________________      _______________________________ 

______________________________      _______________________________ 

______________________________      _______________________________ 

______________________________      _______________________________ 

______________________________      _______________________________ 

 

                                                             CHAIR OF THE BOARD OF TRUSTEES    

          Community College District No. 507 

 
 ____________________________________ 

 
 
Attest: 
 
________________________________ 



Secretary 
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AGENDA ITEM: 13B 
 
AGENDA TITLE: BOARD CONSIDERATION OF APPROVAL OF TRAVEL 

EXPENDITURES FOR TRUSTEES 
 
MEETING DATE: August 22, 2019 
 
RESOURCE: Dr. Stephen Nacco 
     
SUBMITTED FOR: APPROVAL 
 
SUMMARY: Per Public Law 99-0604, known as the “Local Government Travel 

Expense Control Act,” travel expenses for members of the Board of 
Trustees must be approved at an open meeting of the Board.   

 
A total of $249.40 was expended for travel expenditures for trustees over 
the last month for expenses for the ICCTA Executive Committee Retreat 
at John A. Logan on August 1-3, 2019 for Mr. Greg Wolfe.                 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
ACTION: May we ask the Board to approve the travel expenses as listed above.       
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Board Consideration of Resolution to Place  

Tentative FY2020 Budget on Display and  
Set Date, Time, and Place of Public Hearing  

on September 26, 2019 (FY2020  
Tentative Budget-External Exhibit) 

     
 
 
  
 
  
 
 
 
 
  
 
 



AGENDA ITEM:  13C 
 
AGENDA TITLE: BOARD CONSIDERATION OF RESOLUTION TO PLACE 

TENTATIVE FY2020  BUDGET ON DISPLAY AND SET DATE, 
TIME, AND PLACE OF PUBLIC HEARING ON SEPTEMBER 26, 
2019 (FY 2020 Tentative Budget – External Exhibit) 

 
DATE:    August 22, 2019 
 
RESOURCE;   Dr. Stephen Nacco, Tammy Betancourt 
 
SUBMITTED FOR:  Action 
 
SUMMARY:  The proposed FY2020 budget is being submitted to you this 
    evening.  An operational budget of $17,108,068 is recommended.   

This is approximately 2.9% more than the FY2019 Operating budget.  
With the adoption of a FY20 budget at the state level, including an 
increase of over $400,000 in our operating and equalization grants, 
the College will be able to move forward by investing in Human 
Resources to maintain quality student service, provide training needed 
to meet the employment demands of the community, provide training 
needed for assessment of student learning outcomes, add a gaming 
program for our students, cover software increases in Colleague and 
Blackboard, and add network monitoring software. 

 
    Depending on the fluctuation in the Equalized Assessed Valuation, 
    the tax levy rate is anticipated to be approximately 60.96 cents.  The  
    current rate is 60.70 cents.  From FY98 through FY01, the rate was 66  
    cents.  The rate in FY18 was 62.55 cents.   
 
    Expenditures in the Board Restricted Fund support contingencies for 

one-time expenditures that may occur. 
 
     
 
 
 
 
 
 
ACTION 
REQUESTED:   May we ask the Board to consider establishing Thursday, 
    September 26, 2019 at 5:30 p.m. in the Board Room, Vermilion 
    Hall Room 302, at Danville Area Community College as the 
    date, time, and place for the Public Hearing on the FY20 
    budget.  May we further ask the Board to consider making 
    said budget available for public inspection with appropriate 
    notification provided to the public with final approval anticipated 
    at the September 26, 2019 Board meeting.  
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Board Consideration of Bids for CNC Lathe 

     
 
 
  
 
  
 
 
 
 
  
 
 



AGENDA ITEM: 13D 
 
AGENDA TITLE: BOARD CONSIDERATION OF BIDS FOR CNC LATHE 
 
RESOURCE:  Todd Flessner, Dave Kietzmann, Mike Cunningham  
 
MEETING DATE: August 22, 2019 
 
SUBMITTED FOR: ACTION 
 
SUMMARY: Bids were advertised in the Commercial News and News Gazette (including 

online) for a new CNC Lathe to be used in the Tech Center Machine Shop.  A 
bid opening was held at 10.30 AM on Monday, August 5, 2019 with the 
following results. 

 
  
 $ 41,930.00 Haas HFO Chicago, Elk Grove Village, IL 
 NO BID 520 Machinery, Schaumburg, IL 
 NO BID Mazak Machinery Systems, Schaumburg, IL  
 NO BID DEPCO Enterprises, Braidwood, IL 
 
 
 
 This CNC Lathe was approved on the FY-20 Capital Equipment List and 

funding will be through Perkins Grants. 
 
  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
ACTION: May we ask the Board to consider the low bid of $41,930.00 from Haas HFO 

Chicago for a new CNC Lathe for the Tech Center Machine Shop 
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AGENDA ITEM:  13E 
 
AGENDA TITLE: BOARD CONSIDERATION FOR PURCHASE OF TWO USED 2015 

FREIGHTLINER CASCADIA SEMI TRACTORS 
 
DATE:   August 22, 2019 
 
RESOURCE:  Pete Powell, Dave Kietzmann, Mike Cunningham  
 
SUBMITTED FOR: ACTION 
 
SUMMARY: The Tractor Trailer Driving Program has a need for two trucks to meet the 

needs of our larger classes.  Pete Powell, Coordinator of our Tractor Trailer 
Driver & Public Safety Programs searched for two 2015 used Freightliner 
Tractors.  These trucks would replace the 2015 International truck we 
currently lease, which has 131,301 miles and has had numerous costly 
mechanical repairs.  This proposal to purchase these two trucks will save an 
estimated $40,000 over the next five years. 

 
 Following are quotes received for two used 2015 trucks: 
  

$   90,000.00 Young Trucks, Canton, OH 
$   95,200.00 Schneider Truck Sales, Gary, IN 
$ 110,900.00 M & T Truck Sales, Burr Ridge, IL 
 

  
This equipment was approved on the FY-20 Capital Equipment List and 
funding will be through Technology Bonds. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
ACTION 
REQUESTED: May we ask the Board to consider the low bid from Young Trucks in the 

amount of $ 90,000.00 to purchase two used 2015 Freightliner Cascadia Semi 
Trucks. 
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AGENDA ITEM: 13F 
 
AGENDA TITLE: BOARD CONSIDERATION OF BIDS FOR BREMER THEATER STAGE 

LIGHTING SYSTEM REPLACEMENT 
 
RESOURCE:  Mark Barnes, Mike Cunningham 
 
MEETING DATE: August 22, 2019 
 
SUBMITTED FOR: ACTION 
 
SUMMARY: Bids were advertised for the Replacement of the Bremer Theater Stage Lighting 

System. This project consists of furnishing all materials, components, and labor 
necessary to provide a complete and operational system.  A pre-bid meeting was 
held August 1, 2019 at 2:00 PM in the Bremer Theater.   

 
 Bids were opened at 2:00 PM August 15, 2019 with the following results. 
 

$ 67,859.00 Glesco Electric Inc., Urbana, IL 
$ 79,900.00 Anderson Electric, Inc., Danville, IL 
NO BID Thompson Electronics Co., Peoria, IL 
NO BID KSA Lighting, Toluca, IL 
 
  
 
This project was approved on the FY-19 Capital Equipment List and funding 
will be through Tech Equipment Bonds. 

 
  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
ACTION: May we ask the Board to consider the low base bid of $67,859.00 from Glesco 

Electric to Replace the Bremer Theater Stage Lighting system. 
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