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Mission Statement  
 

Danville Area Community College is committed to providing 
quality, innovative, and accessible learning experiences that 
meet the life-long academic, cultural, and economic needs of 

our diverse communities and the world we share. 
 
 

Non-Discrimination Statement 
Danville Area Community College does not discriminate on the basis of race, color, national origin, sex, disability 

or age in its programs and activities.  Inquiries may be directed to Jill A. Cranmore, Vice President, Human 
Resources, Affirmative Action Officer, Title IX Coordinator, and Section 504/ADA Coordinator, Danville Area 
Community College, 2000 E. Main St., Martin Luther King Memorial Way, Danville, IL  61832-5199, 217-443-

8756, or jcranmore@dacc.edu. 

      
 



 
 
 
 
 
 
  
  

 
 
Danville Area Community College will continue to be nationally recognized leader in student 
success and an active partner in building and maintaining academic excellence and the 
economic vitality of the communities it serves. 

 
 

Core Values 

Integrity     
Trusting relationships and an ethical reputation with those we serve (students, faculty, 
employees, community, business, other educational institutions, government). 

Excellence 
Consistently achieving exceptional results that delight those we serve. 

Communication 
Positive and productive relationships and environment for those we serve. 

Adaptability 
Continuously meeting the changing needs of those we serve. 

Diversity 
Providing a safe and secure learning environment for the personal and intellectual 
growth of those we serve, preparing them to participate in an increasingly changing 
world.   
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 

Vision Statement 



BOARD OF TRUSTEES 
Community College District No. 507 

Regular Meeting 
DACC Board Room, Vermilion Hall 302 

Thursday, May 23, 2019 
5:30 p.m. 

 

 

AGENDA 

1. Call to Order 

2. Pledge of Allegiance 

3. Roll Call 

4. Adoption of Agenda 

5. Recognition of Visitors 

6. Report on Adult Education and Middle College 

7. Report on ICCTA Lobby Day, May 1, 2019 

8. Financial Update 

9. President’s Report 

10. Public Comment 

 

12.    Unfinished Business 

13.  New Business 

 A. Board Consideration of Property/Liability Insurance for FY2020 

 B. Board Consideration of Audit Services 

 C. Board Consideration of Renewal of Contract with Follett Higher Education       

Group, Inc. for Bookstore Operations 

 D. Board Discussion of Preliminary FY-2021 ICCB Resource Allocation and 

Management Plan (RAMP) 

 E. Board Consideration of Making Written Closed Session Minutes Open to                 

the Public 

 

 

 

 

Consent Agenda Items are considered to be routine, non-controversial matters and will be considered together and 
enacted by one motion and one roll call.  Any Trustee desiring to remove an item for separate consideration should 
so request before approval of the agenda. 
 

11. Consent Agenda  

A. Board Consideration of the Minutes of the Regular Board Meeting of                     

April 25, 2019 

B. Financial Report 

C. Human Resources Report 
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 F. Board Consideration of Bids for Elevator Maintenance 

 G. Board Consideration of Bids for Trash Removal 

 H. Board Consideration of Bids for Termite and Pest Control 

 I. Board Consideration of Bids for Fire Alarm, Intrusion Alarm, and Security Camera 

Maintenance 

 J. Board Consideration to Lease Two (2) Minibuses 

14. Information 

 A. Communications 

15. Closed Session for Deliberations Concerning Collective Negotiating Matters; Deliberations 

Concerning Salary Schedules for One or More Classes of Employees; and Approval of the 

Written Closed Session Minutes of March 28, 2019 

16. Adjournment 

 

   

   MAY 2019 

  27 Memorial Day Holiday – College Closed 

  JUNE 2019 

 7-8 ICCTA Annual Convention, Itasca 

 10 Regular Summer Classes Begin 

 27 DACC Board of Trustees Meeting, 5:30 p.m., Vermilion Hall Room 302 

  JULY 2019 

   4 Independence Day Holiday – College Closed 

 12 DACC Golf Outing 

 18 DACC Board of Trustees Meeting, 5:30 p.m., Vermilion Hall Room 302 

 AUGUST 2019 

          15-16 Fall In-Service  

 19 Regular Fall Classes Begin 

 22 DACC Board of Trustees Meeting, 5:30 p.m., Vermilion Hall Room 302 

SEPTEMBER 2019 

   2 Labor Day Holiday – College Closed 

          13-14 ICCTA Board of Representatives Meeting, Springfield  

 26 DACC Board of Trustees Meeting, 5:30 p.m., Vermilion Hall Room 302 
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Report on Adult Education and Middle College 
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Report on ICCTA Lobby Day, May 1, 2019 



 
 
    BOARD AGENDA ITEM 8 
 
 
 
 
 
  

 
Financial Update 



     

FY19 FY18 FY19/FY18
OPERATING FUNDS FULL YR YTD % YTD YTD Variance

(EDUCATION; OPERATIONS & MAINTENANCE) PROP BUDG 4/30/2019 OF TOTAL 4/30/2018 % Fav (Unfav)

REVENUES

1   Property Tax Revenue 4,698,000 3,567,309 76 % (A) 3,468,169 76 % 99,140
2   Personal Property Replacement Tax (PPRT) 525,000 324,878 62 % (B) 314,395 51 % 10,483
3   ICCB Base Operating Grants 1,542,760 1,093,740 71 % (C) 2,230,149 93 % (1,136,409)
4   ICCB Equalization Grant 2,052,760 1,368,504 67 % (C) 2,410,253 83 % (1,041,749)
5   CTE Vocational Cr Hr Reimbursement 170,000 94,590 56 % (C) 290,650 79 % (196,060)
6   Tuition 7,200,000 7,302,673 101 % (D) 7,263,539 104 % 39,134
7   Fees 1,500,000 1,357,655 91 % (D) 1,415,503 94 % (57,848)
8   Less:  Institutional Scholarships/Waivers (1,705,000) (2,059,702) 121 % (D) (1,668,559) 128 % (391,143)
9   Interest Income 11,000 38,262 348 % (E) 10,533 192 % 27,729

10   Transfers from Other Funds 430,000 13,118 3 % (E) 31,364 6 % (18,246)
11   Facility Rent Revenue/Chargebacks/Other 212,100 189,717 89 % (H) 133,630 59 % 56,087

12 TOTAL OPERATING REVENUES 16,636,620 13,290,744 80 % 15,899,626 84 % (2,608,882)

EXPENDITURES BY OBJECT

13   Salaries 10,797,599 9,373,744 87 % 8,980,065 87 % (393,679)
14   Employee Benefits 2,341,705 1,836,586 78 % 1,989,964 81 % 153,378
15   Contractual Services 592,345 443,541 75 % (E) 374,900 70 % (68,641)
16   Materials & Supplies 1,507,653 1,342,410 89 % (F) 1,221,224 88 % (121,186)
17   Meetings, Travel, Conferences 242,441 127,617 53 % (E) 115,409 54 % (12,208)
18   Fixed Charges 248,377 202,273 81 % (E) 217,327 100 % 15,054
19   Utilities 810,000 613,217 76 % (G) 601,234 74 % (11,983)
20   Capital Outlay 24,500 42,109 172 % (H) 30,609 87 % (11,500)
21   Transfers to other Funds/Other 72,000 40,046 56 % (E) 71,532 85 % 31,486

22 TOTAL OPERATING EXPENDITURES 16,636,620 14,021,543 84 % 13,602,264 85 % (419,279)

23 NET REVENUE/(EXPENDITURE) 0 (730,799) 2,297,362 (3,028,161)

NOTES:

(A) Amounts are recorded quarterly at the end of each quarter.  Revenue is based on 2018 Levy.
Majority of funds will be received (cash) in FY20.

(B) Majority of revenue is received in the second half of the fiscal year.
(C) Amounts received from ICCB will not be even.  Base Operating includes Performance Based Funding.

   CTE Funding Allocation $189,180 - $19,180 more than budgeted
(D) Revenue is primarily received at the beginning of each semester and institutional waivers/scholarships are awarded

    near the beginning of the semester.
(E) This revenue or expense item does not occur evenly over the year; interest rates are higher than expected.
(F) Instructional material and supply spending is accelerated prior to the beginning of each semester.
(G) Payments on utility bills are approximately two months in arrears.  Invoice for July service has a

   billing date of August and a payment due date of September.
(H) Includes Foundation donation for welding equipment

DANVILLE AREA COMMUNITY COLLEGE

FINANCIAL STATEMENT OF REVENUE AND EXPENDITURES
FOR  THE OPERATING FUNDS

       FY19 - Year to Date - July 1, 2018 - April 30, 2019
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President’s Report 
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Public Comment 



 CONSENT AGENDA ITEM 11A    
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Board Consideration of the Minutes of the  
Regular Board Meeting of April 25, 2019 



MINUTES OF THE REGULAR MEETING of April 25, 2019 
On April 25, 2019, the Board of Trustees of Community College District 507, in the 
Counties of Vermilion, Edgar, Iroquois, Champaign, and Ford in the State of Illinois, met in 
regular session in the Board Room, Vermilion Hall Room 302 at Danville Area Community 
College.       
 
ITEM 1: CALL TO ORDER 
Chairman Dave Harby called the meeting to order at 5:30 p.m. 
 
ITEM 2: PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE 
Ms. Rachelle Tiu, Presidential Scholar, led the Board and those in attendance in reciting the 
Pledge of Allegiance to the Flag.     
 
ITEM 3: ROLL CALL 
The roll was called.  Trustees present:  Dave Harby, Terry Hill, John Spezia, and Greg 
Wolfe.  Trustees absent:  Bill Black, Tracy Cherry and Dr. Ron Serfoss.    
 
Others present:  President Dr. Stephen Nacco, Board Secretary Kerri Thurman, Dave 
Kietzmann, Tammy Betancourt, Jill Cranmore, Mike Cunningham, Lara Conklin, Jerry 
Davis, Brian Hensgen, Stacy Ehmen, Mark Barnes, Laura Hensgen, Ashley Hargrove, 
Ronnie Johnson, Dr. Eric Simonson, Kelsee Landers, Audrey Baker, Lauren Proehl, Collin 
Wright, Kathryn Taylor, Jim Acklin, Christina Oakley, Diamond Holmes, Holley 
Hambleton, and Rachelle Tiu.                                                                                                                      
 
Media present:  None.    
 
ITEM 4: ADOPTION OF AGENDA 
Mr. Harby asked if there were any changes requested to the agenda.  With no changes 
requested, upon motion by Mr. Wolfe, and a second by Mr. Hill, the agenda was approved 
as presented.  The motion passed by unanimous voice vote:  4 yeas, 0 nays.   
 
ITEM 5: RECOGNITION OF VISITORS 
Dr. Nacco introduced the following members of the Administrative Council:  Dave 
Kietzmann, Executive Vice President, Instruction and Student Services; Tammy 
Betancourt, Vice President, Finance/Chief Financial Officer; Jill Cranmore, Vice President, 
Human Resources; Mike Cunningham, Vice President, Administrative Services; Lara 
Conklin, Executive Director, College Relations; Brian Hensgen, Executive Director, 
Workforce Development; and Stacy Ehmen, Dean, Student Services.  Also present:  Jerry 
Davis, Davis & Delanois; Mark Barnes, Director, Computer Networking and End User 
Services; Laura Hensgen, Director, Community Education and Video Development; Ashley 
Hargrove, Instructor, Business Administrative Technology; Ronnie Johnson, Instructor, 
Art/PTK Advisor; Dr. Eric Simonson, Professor, Music; Audrey Baker, Lauren Proehl, and 
Kelsee Landers (One Stop Operator Assistant, American Job Center), Business 
Administrative Technology Students; Jim Acklin, Coach, Cross Country; Christina Oakley 
and Diamond Holmes, Cross Country Team Members; Holley Hambleton, Student Trustee; 
and Rachelle Tiu, Presidential Scholar.               
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Media present:  None.   
 
ITEM 6: RECOGNITION OF PHI THETA KAPPA 2019 ALL-ILLINOIS 
ACADEMIC TEAM 
The Phi Theta Kappa 2019 All-Illinois Academic Team members were recognized by the 
Board.  Art Instructor and PTK Advisor Mr. Ronnie Johnson introduced Ms. Kathryn 
Taylor and Mr. Collin Wright who shared their majors and future plans.  Mr. Johnson 
reported Mr. Parker Burch was also named to the academic team, but was unable to attend 
the meeting.   
 
Mr. Harby presented Mr. Johnson with a five-year pin from PTK for his years of dedicated 
service as the advisor for the DACC PTK Chapter. 
 
The Board and Dr. Nacco congratulated Ms. Taylor, Mr. Wright, and Mr. Johnson on their 
outstanding achievements.   
 
ITEM 7: RECOGNITION OF DACC ACADEMIC ALL-AMERICAN CROSS 
COUNTRY TEAM MEMBERS 
The DACC Academic All-American Cross Country Team members were recognized.  
Coach Jim Acklin introduced Ms. Christina Oakley and Ms. Diamond Holmes.  Ms. 
Marissa Uplinger and Coach Travis Winkler were unable to attend the meeting.  Ms. 
Oakley and Ms. Holmes introduced themselves and shared their majors and future plans. 
 
The Board and Dr. Nacco congratulated Ms. Oakley and Ms. Holmes on their academic and 
athletic success. 
 
ITEM 8: INTRODUCTION OF BUSINESS ADMINISTRATIVE 
TECHNOLOGY STUDENTS 
Business Administrative Technology Instructor Ms. Ashley Hargrove introduced Ms. 
Kelsee Landers, Ms. Audrey Baker, and Ms. Lauren Proehl as students in the Business 
Administrative Technology program.  The students are currently studying formal meetings, 
preparation of documents, and the keeping of good records of meetings.  The students then 
shared information about themselves to the Board. 
 
The Board and Dr. Nacco thanked the students for attending the meeting. 
 
ITEM 9: NJCAA REPORT 
Mr. Brian Hensgen gave an update regarding NJCAA.  He reported that he, Mike Hulvey, 
and Jeanne Cooke went to Richmond Virginia to the NJCAA Annual Conference and were 
successful in receiving approval for DACC to host the NJCAA tournaments in 2021, 2022, 
and 2023. 
 
Mr. Hensgen noted the tournament would not be possible without the 300+ community 
volunteers.  He shared additional information regarding the tournament such as there were 
46 tournament sponsors, 63 restaurant sponsors for the Hospitality Room, 488 attendees at 
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the Banquet; and the overall attendance was approximately 13,750 which included 1,006 
students. 
 
A video prepared by Ms. Laura Hensgen was viewed by the group.  The video was also 
shown at the NJCAA conference. 
 
The Board and Dr. Nacco thanked Mr. and Mrs. Hensgen for their efforts in making the 
2019 tournament a success.   
 
ITEM 10: FINANCIAL UPDATE 
Ms. Tammy Betancourt gave a financial update to the Board.  The Financial Statement of 
Revenue and Expenditures ending March 31, 2019 was included in the Board agenda book. 
 
ITEM 11: PRESIDENT’S REPORT 
Dr. Nacco shared the DACC Flash with the Board and highlighted the events from the 
month since the last meeting.       
 
ITEM 12: PUBLIC COMMENT 
There was no public comment.             
 
ITEM 13: CONSENT AGENDA 

A. BOARD CONSIDERATION OF THE MINUTES OF THE 
REGULAR BOARD MEETING OF MARCH 28, 2019 

B. FINANCIAL REPORT 
C. HUMAN RESOURCES REPORT 

Upon motion by Mr. Hill, and a second by Mr. Wolfe, the Board approved the items on the 
Consent Agenda.  The motion passed by roll call vote:  4 yeas, 0 nays.    
 
ITEM 14: UNFINISHED BUSINESS 
 
ITEM 15: SEATING OF STUDENT TRUSTEE 

A. ACCEPTANCE OF STUDENT TRUSTEE ELECTION REPORT 
B. ADMINISTRATION OF OATH OF OFFICE 

Ms. Holley Hambleton was elected as Student Trustee effective April 15, 2019.  Ms. 
Hambleton is a graduate of Armstrong High School and is majoring in nursing.  She also 
plays softball.   
 
Upon motion by Mr. Wolfe, and a second by Mr. Spezia, the Board accepted the Student 
Trustee Election Report.  The motion passed by roll call vote:  4 yeas, 0 nays. 
 
Mr. Harby administered the Oath of Office to Ms. Hambleton.  The Board congratulated 
Ms. Hambleton and welcomed her as the new Student Trustee.   
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ITEM 16: BOARD CONSIDERATION OF DOCUMENTS OF APRIL 2, 2019 
CONSOLIDATED ELECTION FOR COMMUNITY COLLEGE DISTRICT NO. 507 
TRUSTEES 

A. ADOPTION OF RESOLUTION DECLARING RESULTS OF 
ELECTION 

B. APPROVAL OF ABSTRACT OF VOTES 
Upon motion by Mr. Hill, and a second by Mr. Spezia, the Board adopted the resolution 
declaring the results of the election naming Charlotte “Tracy” Cherry, Greg Wolfe, and 
Ronald E. Serfoss as winners of the election.  The motion passed by roll call vote:  5 yeas, 0 
nays. 
 
Upon motion by Mr. Spezia, and a second by Mr. Hill, the Board approved the Abstract of 
Votes submitted by Cathy Jenkins, Vermilion County Clerk, showing vote totals of 5,756 
for Charlotte “Tracy” Cherry, 5,961 for Greg Wolfe, and 7,377 for Ronald E. Serfoss.  The 
motion passed by roll call vote:  5 yeas, 0 nays. 
 
ITEM 17: OATH OF OFFICE ADMINISTERED TO NEWLY ELECTED 
MEMBERS 
Mr. Harby administered the Oath of Office to Mr. Wolfe. 
 
ITEM 18: ADJOURNMENT OF BOARD SINE DIE 
Mr. Harby adjourned the Board sine die. 
 
ITEM 19: ROLL CALL – REORGANIZED BOARD 
Roll was called.  Trustees present:  Dave Harby, Terry Hill, John Spezia, Greg Wolfe, and 
Student Trustee Holley Hambleton.  Trustees absent:  Bill Black, Tracy Cherry, and Dr. 
Ron Serfoss. 
 
ITEM 20: APPOINTMENT OF TEMPORARY CHAIRPERSON 
Upon motion by Mr. Wolfe, and a second by Mr. Hill, Mr. Dave Harby was appointed as 
temporary chairperson.  The motion passed by roll call vote:  5 yeas, 0 nays. 
 
ITEM 21: APPOINTMENT OF TEMPORARY SECRETARY 
Upon motion by Mr. Spezia, and a second by Mr. Wolfe, Ms. Kerri Thurman was appointed 
as temporary secretary.  The motion passed by roll call vote:  5 yeas, 0 nays. 
 
ITEM 22: ELECTION OF OFFICERS AND APPOINTMENTS 

A. ELECTION OF CHAIR 
A motion was made by Mr. Wolfe to nominate Mr. Harby as Chair.  The motion was 
seconded by Mr. Spezia and passed by roll call vote:  5 yeas, 0 nays. 
 

B. ELECTION OF VICE CHAIR 
A motion was made by Mr. Spezia to nominate Mr. Wolfe as Vice Chair; however, Mr. 
Wolfe removed his name as a nominee.     
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A motion was made by Mr. Wolfe to nominate Dr. Serfoss as Vice Chair.  The motion was 
seconded by Mr. Hill and passed by roll call vote:  5 yeas, 0 nays. 
 

C. ELECTION OF SECRETARY 
A motion was made by Mr. Wolfe to nominate Kerri Thurman as Board Secretary.  The 
motion was seconded by Mr. Hill and passed by roll call vote:  5 yeas, 0 nays. 
 

D. APPOINTMENT OF ICCTA REPRESENTATIVE 
A motion was made by Mr. Spezia to appoint Mr. Wolfe as the ICCTA Representative.  
The motion was seconded by Mr. Hill and passed by roll call vote:  5 yeas, 0 nays. 
 

E. APPOINTMENT OF ICCTA ALTERNATE REPRESENTATIVE 
A motion was made by Mr. Spezia to appoint Mr. Hill as the ICCTA Alternate 
Representative.  The motion was seconded by Mr. Wolfe and passed by roll call vote:  5 
yeas, 0 nays. 
 

F. APPOINTMENT OF BOARD ATTORNEYS 
Upon motion by Mr. Wolfe, and a second by Mr. Hill, the Board appointed the law firm of 
Davis and Delanois to serve as legal counsel for the DACC Board of Trustees and the 
College.  The motion passed by roll call vote:  5 yeas, 0 nays. 
 

G. APPOINTMENT OF COLLEGE TREASURER 
Upon motion by Mr. Hill, and a second by Mr. Wolfe, the Board appointed Tammy 
Betancourt as the College Treasurer until the next reorganizational meeting of the Board.  
The motion passed by roll call vote:  5 yeas, 0 nays. 
 
ITEM 23: BOARD CONSIDERATION OF SETTING DATE, TIME, AND 
PLACE OF MEETINGS 
Upon motion by Mr. Wolfe, and a second by Mr. Spezia, the Board approved the setting of 
the date, time and place of meetings until the next reorganizational meeting.  The motion 
passed by roll call vote:  5 yeas, 0 nays. 
 
Regular meetings will take place on the fourth Thursday of each month in Vermilion Hall 
Room 302 with the following exceptions:  July 18, 2019; November 21, 2019; December 
19, 2019; July 16, 2020; August 20, 2020; November 19, 2020; and December 17, 2020 
will be held on the third Thursday of the month.  The November 21, 2019 and November 
19, 2020 meetings will be held at the Hoopeston Higher Learning Center, 847 East Orange 
Street, Hoopeston, Illinois.   
 
ITEM 24: BOARD CONSIDERATION OF ADOPTING ALL EXISTING 
POLICIES 
Upon motion by Mr. Wolfe, and a second by Mr. Hill, the Board adopted all existing 
policies.  The motion passed by roll call vote:  5 yeas, 0 nays. 
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ITEM 25: NEW BUSINESS 
A. BOARD CONSIDERATION OF NEW BOARD POLICY - #4062 – 

LEAVE SHARE POLICY 
For some time, employees have expressed an interest in having the ability to “share” their 
time when fellow employees are in need of extra days due to extenuating circumstances.  A 
Committee was formed to review the possibility and to propose a policy.  The proposed 
policy was vetted throughout the College community, including the Governance Forum. 
 
Upon motion by Mr. Hill, and a second by Mr. Spezia, the Board approved the new Board 
Policy #4062 – Leave Share Policy.  The motion passed by roll call vote:  5 yeas, 0 nays. 
 

B. BOARD CONSIDERATION OF SABBATICAL LEAVE 
PROPOSAL/AGREEMENT 

Dr. Eric Simonson, Music Professor, has requested a sabbatical leave for August 1, 2019 
through July 31, 2020.  During the term of the requested sabbatical leave, Dr. Simonson 
will be compensated at 50% of his regular salary for the requested leave.  He has agreed to 
continue to work with the College Pep Band and Choral group during his sabbatical.  Dr. 
Simonson has signed the Sabbatical Leave Agreement and consent to return to DACC after 
completing the leave. 
 
Upon motion by Mr. Wolfe, and a second by Mr. Hill, the Board approved the sabbatical 
leave proposal and agreement for Dr. Eric Simonson, Music Professor.  The motion passed 
by roll call vote:  5 yeas, 0 nays.   
 

C. BOARD CONSIDERATION OF MOBILE APP 
Unifyed’s mobile app will help DACC faculty and staff communicate with students where 
they are most comfortable and accessible – on their phones.  Unifyed’s product is built 
exclusively for higher education to promote immersive student experiences, increase 
operational efficiency, and provide data-rich insights for staff to boost retention and create a 
student-centered campus.  Stand-out features include single sign-on integration with 
Colleague/Self-Service (student schedule, financial aid, grades), Google e-mail, and 
Blackboard; constant engagement strategies as student-users keep abreast of their academic 
and extra-curricular life on campus in one convenient location; and the ability for students 
to access information (direct messages, Facebook, Twitter, YouTube) and communicate 
with faculty, staff, and other students in their favorite, mobile world. 
 
The cost for the first year is $18,664.91 which includes a discount of $8,783.49.  The cost 
for the second and third years is $14,244.91 each year which includes a discount of 
$6,703.49 each year. 
 
Upon motion by Mr. Wolfe, and a second by Mr. Hill, the Board approved the DACC 
Mobile App.  The motion passed by roll call vote:  5 yeas, 0 nays. 
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D. BOARD CONSIDERATION OF RETIREMENTS 
1. VIV DUDLEY, PROFESSOR, MARKETING 

Marketing Professor Viv Dudley has submitted her letter of intent to retire effective July 
31, 2019 after 32 years of service. 
 
The Board and Dr. Nacco expressed appreciation to Professor Dudley and wished her well 
in her upcoming retirement. 
 
Upon motion by Mr. Hill, and a second by Mr. Wolfe, the Board approved the retirement of 
Marketing Professor Viv Dudley effective July 31, 2019.  The motion passed by roll call 
vote:  5 years, 0 nays. 
 

2. SHARON WAGGAMAN, INSTRUCTOR, 
MANUFACTURING/TECHNOLOGY 

Manufacturing/Technology Instructor Sharon Waggaman has submitted her letter of intent 
to retire effective May 31, 2019 after 25 years of service. 
 
The Board and Dr. Nacco also expressed appreciation to Instructor Waggaman and wished 
her well in her upcoming retirement. 
 
Upon motion by Mr. Wolfe, and a second by Mr. Hill, the Board approved the retirement of 
Manufacturing/Technology Instructor Sharon Waggaman effective May 31, 2019.  The 
motion passed by roll call vote:  5 yeas, 0 nays. 
 
ITEM 26: INFORMATION 

A. COMMUNICATIONS 
 Thank you letter from Mr. and Mrs. Jim Gieseke regarding their 

recent tour of the campus. 
 Thank you letters from two 2019-2020 Presidential Scholars. 

 
ITEM 27: ADJOURNMENT 
There being no further business to discuss, Mr. Harby adjourned the meeting at 6:49 p.m. 
       
 
     __________________________________________ 
     Chairperson, Board of Trustees 
 
 
     __________________________________________ 
     Secretary, Board of Trustees 
 
 
Approved:  __________________________________  
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Human Resources 
(Recommendations of Employment are conditional upon all Human Resources processes being 
met.) 
 

1. New Employees 
 

(Notice of Temporary Employment Contract) 
 

Brown, Travis – Intern, Business Office 
Effective Date:  May 15, 2019 through July 31, 2019 
Rate of Pay:  $25.00 per hour 

 
   2. Student Workers 

 
 Bromley, Alexis – Student Employee, Financial Aid Office 
 Effective Date:  May 7, 2019 through June 30, 2019 
 Rate of Pay:  $8.25 per hour 
 

Mandeldove, Andre – Student Employee, Academic Advisement & Counseling 
 Effective Date:  May 16, 2019 through June 30, 2019 
 Rate of Pay:  $8.25 per hour 
 
 Reed, Jerry II – Student Employee, TRIO, Student Success Center 
 Effective Date:  May 6, 2019 through June 30, 2019 
 Rate of Pay:  $8.25 per hour 
 
 Techtow, McKenna- Student Employee, Fitness Center, Math, Science and Health Professions 
 Effective Date:  April 17, 2019 through June 30, 2019 
 Rate of Pay:  $8.25 per hour 
 

3. Resignations 
  

Hicks, Clayton – Workforce Services Assistant, Vermilion County Works 
Effective Date:  May 31, 2019 
 
Huffman, Kristen – Science Lab Assistant, Math Science and Health Professions 

 Effective Date:  May 31, 2019 
 

4. Position Changes 
  
 Hahne, Dr. Abby – Chemistry Instructor/Assessment Director,  

Math, Science and Health Professions 
 Effective Date:  June 10, 2019 
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5. Transfers 
 

Aguirre, Suzanna – Administrative Assistant, Math, Science and Health Professions 
Effective Date:  June 1, 2019 through June 30, 2019 
Rate of Pay:  $33,282.08 
 

 6. Part-time and Additional Instructor Salaries, Spring Semester 2019 
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AGENDA ITEM:  13A 
 
AGENDA TITLE: BOARD CONSIDERATION OF PROPERTY/LIABILITY INSURANCE 

FOR FY-2020 
 
DATE:   May 23, 2019 
 
RESOURCE: Mike Cunningham 
 
SUBMITTED FOR: ACTION 
 
SUMMARY: On behalf of DACC, ONI Risk Partners submitted for quotation to Wright 

Specialty Insurance (WRM), Uniondale, NY, Illinois Counties Risk 
Management Trust (ICRMT), St. Charles, IL, Cincinnati Insurance, 
Cincinnati, OH, and Liberty Mutual Insurance, Indianapolis, IN.  Wright 
Specialty did respond and previously replied they could not compete with 
ICRMT.  Cincinnati could not provide $10,000,000 limits for flood and 
earthquake coverage, and Liberty Mutual could not provide truck driving 
school or wind turbine training coverage.   

 
The insurance proposal (external exhibit) prepared by Corey Potter of ONI 
Risk Partners reflects an overall increase of $20,131.00 in premiums from 
Illinois Counties Risk Management Trust (ICRMT).   This is a result in 
part of last year’s appraisal of all buildings & business personal property 
value’s increase of $16,303,368.  The estimated cost for an appraisal of 
this size would be $10,000.  Our last appraisal was in 2010 and ICRMT 
provided this new appraisal at no cost to DACC.  The premium increase 
was also affected by the addition of $250,000 of Public Crisis Event 
coverage and the addition of $500,000 in Deadly Weapon coverage.   The 
proposed premium for FY-2020 will be $148,712.00.  Please note this 
year’s premium is less than our 2016 premium of $150,811.00 for 
Property & Liability Insurance.  You will also note that ONI did not 
increase their agency fee from last year (external exhibit). 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
ACTION 
REQUESTED: May we ask the Board to approve the premium to ONI Insurance in the 

amount of $148,712.00 for Property & Liability Insurance for FY-2020. 



  BOARD AGENDA ITEM 13B 

 
 
 
 
 

  
Board Consideration of Audit Services 

 
  

     
 
 
  
 
  
 
 
 
 
  
 
 



Agenda Item:  13B 
 
Agenda Title:  BOARD CONSIDERATION OF AUDIT SERVICES 
 
Meeting Date:  May 23, 2019 
 
Resource:  Tammy Betancourt 
   Dr. Stephen Nacco 
 
Submitted for:  Action 
 
Summary: A request for proposal (RFP) for auditing services was mailed to 

seven (7) firms, CliftonLarsonAllen LLP (CLA), Wipfli LLP, 
Sikich, LLP, Martin Hood, RSM US LLP, Plante Moran, PLLC 
and Knutte & Associates, P.C.  These firms requested to be placed 
on our RFP distribution list.  In addition, an ad was placed in the 
Commercial News and the News Gazette indicating the College 
was seeking audit services proposals.  We received four (4) 
proposals from CLA, Wipfli LLP, Sikich and Martin Hood.  RSM 
and Plante Moran declined to propose and the RFP that was sent to 
Knutte & Associates was returned with no forwarding address and 
an alternative address was not found.  

 
Based on reviews of the proposals, our recommendation is to 
contract with the firm of Wipfli LLP for auditing services. The fee 
each year is lower than CLA and over the five year period amounts 
to a savings of $17,460.  Additionally, in the first year, the 
proposed fee from Wipfli is $1,000 less than the fee for the prior 
year, so is a decrease from last year’s fee. 
 
Wipfli has provided auditing services to seven (7) other IL 
community colleges in the past five years.  Three (3) of those 
seven (7) prepare a full CAFR and have received the GFOA award.  
References were received from six (6) of those colleges and Wipfli 
is highly recommended. 
 

 Of course, analyzing an auditing firm’s proposal requires more 
consideration than the basic auditing fee.  However, Wipfli will 
provide all required services, more experienced personnel on the 
audit engagement and lower fees. 

 
 
 
Recommendation: May we ask the Board to approve the firm of Wipfli LLP to 

provide audit services for the next five fiscal years beginning with 
the fiscal year ending June 30, 2019. 
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AGENDA ITEM: 13C 
 
AGENDA TITLE: BOARD CONSIDERATION OF RENEWAL OF CONTRACT WITH 

FOLLETT HIGHER EDUCATION GROUP, INC. FOR BOOKSTORE 
OPERATIONS 

 
MEETING DATE: May 23, 2019 
 
RESOURCE: Tammy Betancourt  
     
SUBMITTED FOR: ACTION 
 
SUMMARY: Effective July 1, 2014, DACC partnered with Follett Higher Education 

Group, Inc. (Follett) to provide Bookstore Management and Operations 
for a period of five years.  The landscape of the higher education textbook 
industry remains uncertain, especially considering the emphasis nationally 
on lowering the cost of course materials to students to ensure successful 
outcomes.  The options today have multiplied greatly from five years ago.   
The faculty, along with Follett, have done a commendable job of applying 
innovative and creative ideas to assist in achieving this goal.  From custom 
publishing, to utilization of Open Educational Resources (OER), to 
selecting rentable materials, to the adoption of Follett’s includEd program 
which allows students to have needed materials on the first day of class by 
transitioning the cost to a student fee rather than a direct payment to the 
bookstore, and to the ability of students to incorporate book costs to a 
payment plan, DACC faculty, staff and Follett staff have worked tirelessly 
to ensure course materials are affordable to all of our students.    

 
 Follett has been a valuable partner for the College and for our students 

over the last five years.  They are the expert in the higher education 
textbook industry and this partnership allows DACC faculty and staff to 
focus on our students and outcomes rather than navigating the unchartered 
waters the industry is diving into. 

 
As a reminder, when contracting with Follett in 2014, they committed to 
providing up to $200,000 in renovations to our existing Bookstore 
facilities, $28,000 towards the installations of point-of-sale and store 
management systems and $5,000 annually in textbook scholarships.  In the 
original contract it was agreed that these leasehold improvements would 
be amortized over a period of eight (8) years and upon termination, 
expiration or non-renewal of that agreement, the College would be 
obligated to re-pay to Follett the unamortized book value on all store 
remodeling.  Including the installations of the point-of-sale and store 
management systems, the unamortized book value as of June 30, 2019 that 
the College would be obligate to re-pay to Follett upon non-renewal of the 
contract would be $85,500. 
 
 
 



In light of the successful partnership we’ve experienced over the last five 
years, along with this potential financial obligation, Follett was requested 
to provide a proposal for a three (3) year renewal.  The renewal provided 
for commissions of 8.10% of all commissionable sales up to $1,000,000 
and 9.6% on any part of commissionable sales over $1,000,000, a first 
year guarantee amount of $50,000 and $3,000 annually in textbook 
scholarships. 
 
While our current contract commission percentages are 13.75% and 
14.25%, respectively, Follett has indicated that over the last several years 
the store has incurred a net loss and thus needs to reduce commission 
percentages in order to “balance the equation”.  Sales have been declining 
each year due to lower enrollment, added programs and a shift in course 
materials strategy (e.g. all inclusive, OER content, etc.), however they are 
focusing on “driving sales and service through various initiatives like 
Follett Discover View and Shop, Financial Aid integration, .edu search 
terms, shop by student ID etc.” 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

ACTION: May we ask the Board to approve renewing the contract with Follett 
Higher Education Group to provide Bookstore Management and 
Operations for a period of three years.     



 
 
 

Renewal Term Sheet – Danville Area Community College 
 
Commission 
Follett offers a competitive three-year financial proposal that offers you a commission based on the 
store’s sales as follows: 
 

8.10% of all Commissionable Sales up to $1,000,000; plus 
9.60% of any part of Commissionable Sales over $1,000,000. 

 
Because our revenue estimates have consistently proven accurate, we will pay you a Guaranteed Annual 
Income of $50,000 in the first year. 
 
You will receive whichever is greater in any contract year: 
 
1) the percentage of Commissionable Sales or 
2) the Guaranteed Annual Income. In any partial contract year, the commission will be based on the 
applicable percentage and not on the Guaranteed Annual Income. 
 
If in the first full contract year during the term of this agreement, calculated commission payments to the 
College are less than $50,000 (“Guaranteed Annual Income”), Follett will pay your institution an additional 
amount necessary to bring total payments to your institution for that year up to the Guaranteed Annual 
Income. Follett will provide a Guaranteed Annual Income in all future years of this agreement that will be 
an amount equal to ninety percent (90%) of the calculated commission on Commissionable Sales of the 
immediately preceding year. 
 

Terms 
Payments will be made quarterly, twenty days after the end of the quarter.  Follett may deduct past due 
accounts receivable charges that are more than 120 days in arrears from commission payments. 
 
Commissionable Sales Definition 
Commissionable Sales is defined as all recognized revenue (in compliance with generally accepted 
accounting principles) generated through the Store or the Store website, less voids, refunds, sales tax, 
campus debit card fees, discounted sales to authorized School faculty, staff, departments and others as 
may be mutually agreed to under this Agreement, Follett-funded scholarships, handling fees associated 
with non-return of rental textbooks, pass-through income and merchandise sales at less than an inherent 
20% margin (i.e., computer hardware and software). 
 
Commission Payments Processing 
Follett will process commission payments by sending ACH transfers (Direct Deposit) in lieu of paper 
checks. The benefits include: 
 

 Improved timeliness of receiving payment 
 Elimination of lost checks in the mail 
 Elimination of the time and expense of making a bank deposit 
 



Please note that being paid by ACH does not change your payment terms or how often you will receive 
payment. On the day that the ACH payment is made, the designated recipient will receive an email 
indicating that the funds are on the way to the bank. A CSV file (that can be opened in Excel) will be 
attached to the email, which will contain the remit information with the document numbers that were paid 
(similar to the check remittance advice). Please note that this is not a wire transfer. The process takes 
approximately 7–10 business days to process once a necessary form is completed and submitted to 
Follett. 
 

Additional Financial Considerations 
 

Textbook Scholarship  
Follett will provide $3,000 annually in textbook scholarships for each full contract year during the term of 
this Agreement in the form of gift cards or as an accounts receivable account. These scholarships will be 
administered by your administration. 
 

Pricing Policy 

In operating the Store, Follett will charge industry standard, competitive and fair prices as follows: 
 

a) On new textbooks, trade books, coursepacks, text “packages,” “kits,” “sets,” and “bundles,” 
not more than the publishers’ list price, or a 25% gross margin (cost divided by .75) on net 
price books and list price books sold to Follett at less than a 25% discount off list and 
rounded up to the next quarter. 

b) On ebooks and other digital content, when Follett determines the end-user price, not more 
than the publishers’ list price, or a 25% gross margin (cost divided by .75) on net price 
content, and when the publisher determines the end-user price and Follett acts as agent, 
Follett will use the publisher price. 

c) On used books, including cloth, paperback and others, not more than 75% of the new 
textbook selling prices rounded up to the next quarter. 

d) On rental books, Follett will be setting rental fees for each title, and any given title’s fee may 
vary as a percentage of the retail selling price. 

e) On general merchandise, not more than the normal gross profit margin for similar 
merchandise in the college bookstore industry. 

f) includED Program fees (“includED Fees”) will be determined by Follett for each semester or 
summer session and submitted to School. 
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AGENDA ITEM: 13D 
 
AGENDA TITLE: Board Discussion of Preliminary FY-2021 ICCB Resource Allocation and 
   Management Plan (RAMP) 
 
DATE:   May 23, 2019 
 
RESOURCE:  Mike Cunningham 
 
SUBMITTED FOR: DISCUSSION 
 
SUMMARY: The Illinois Community College Board (ICCB) requires the Board of 

Trustees to approve the RAMP report prior to the deadline submission of 
July 1.  The RAMP is being submitted to the DACC Board for discussion, 
and will be finalized for Board approval in June.  Capital Development 
Board (CDB) has requested that all state funded project requests include 
“green” / LEED (Leadership in Energy and Environmental Design) costs 
in the estimated project.   

 
Attached is the DACC CAMPUS MASTER PLAN priority project list 
which provides an annual update of the estimated project costs, funding 
information, and revenues as of May 2019.  Next month’s RAMP agenda 
item for approval will list the updated project costs which will include the 
CDB inflation factor. 
 
 
FY2021 RAMP LIST SUMMARIZED 
   Clock Tower Center Remodeling and Addition 
   Ornamental Horticulture Rehabilitation 
   Campus Storage Facility 
    
    

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
ACTION  May we ask the Board for discussion regarding Campus Master Plan 
REQUESTED: projects to be submitted in the FY 2021 RAMP report to ICCB. 

 
 



DACC CAMPUS MASTER PLAN 
Projects Completed as of May 23, 2019 

 
 
Campus Master Plan Items          Project Cost 
 
 SITE UTILITIES (1A & 1B) PROJECTS  COMPLETED 1996       $5,125,823 
  Includes DACC re-roofing the Clock Tower Center, Asphalting 

New N.W. parking lot and Physical Plant road.     
        

 CHILD DEVELOPMENT CENTER   COMPLETED 1997       $1,368,000 
  

BREMER CONFERENCE CENTER THEATER COMPLETED 1998       $   273,019 
 

MARY MILLER CENTER LOWER LEVEL RENOVATION       $   678,000 
        COMPLETED 1998 

 
LINCOLN HALL & TELECOMMUNICATIONS PROJECT              $8,965,127 

        COMPLETED 1999 
    
 TECHNOLOGY CENTER ADDITION  COMPLETED 1999       $   647,608 
 
 CLOCK TOWER CENTER (LIBRARY/ART RENOVATION)              $1,511,800 
        COMPLETED 2000 
 
 RENOVATE PRAIRIE/VERMILION/CANNON HALLS      $ 12,888,613 
                     COMPLETED 2002     
         
 OPERATIONS FACILITY ADDITION  COMPLETED 2003       $   381,742 
 
 TECHNOLOGY CENTER REHABILITATION COMPLETED 2003        $   119,039 
 
 DEMOLITION OF BUILDINGS 5, 9, 10, & TUNNELS, AND THE       $ 5,446,800 

ADDITION & RENOVATION OF BREMER CONFERENCE AND 
WORKFORCE DEVELOPMENT CENTER COMPLETED 2007        

 
 GREENHOUSE     COMPLETED 2011      $    565,034 
 
 MARY MILLER ADDTION & RENOVATION      COMPLETED 2013      $5,190,400 
 
 TECH CENTER ADDITION      COMPLETED 2015      $ 2,996,400 
 

REMODEL ORNAMENTAL HORTICULTURE COMPLETED 2016      $    100,000 
 
 
TOTAL OF COMPLETED PROJECTS                   $ 46,257,405 

 
 
 
 



Projects submitted on RAMP to ICCB 
 

 

CLOCK TOWER CENTER RENOVATION     * $2,953,600 

 ORNAMENTAL HORTICULTURE REHABILITATION    * $   518,900 

CAMPUS STORAGE FACILITY       * $1,516,900 

TOTAL                   * $4,989,400 

                       x 25% 

  LOCAL 25% MATCH REQUIRED      * $1,247,350 

   

*Note: These are last year’s estimated project costs and matching funds.     
___________________________________________________________________________ 

 
 
 

REVENUES IN RESERVE AS OF MAY 15, 2019 
 

Board Restricted Facility / Construction / Renovation / Reserve   $1,406,981 

Board Restricted Equipment Reserve       $   202,828 

Board Restricted Construction Building Reserve       $   983,733 

GRAND TOTAL OF REVENUES IN RESERVE    $2,503,542 

 Less LOCAL DOLLAR MATCH required above             * $1,247,350 

UNALLOCATED PROJECT FUNDS                 $1,255,992 
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AGENDA ITEM:  13E 
 
AGENDA TITLE: BOARD CONSIDERATION OF MAKING WRITTEN CLOSED 

SESSION MINUTES OPEN TO THE PUBLIC 
 
DATE:   May 23, 2019 
 
RESOURCE: Dr. Stephen Nacco 
 
SUBMITTED FOR: Action 
 
SUMMARY: Public Act 85-1355 requires community college boards to review the 

written minutes of closed sessions in order to determine which written 
minutes may be, in whole or in part, made a part of the public record. 

 
We have reviewed the minutes of the Closed Sessions of: 
 
March 24, 1987 May 24, 2005 December 13, 2018 
September 26, 2000 May 23, 2006 January 24, 2019 
October 24, 2000 April 26, 2011 March 28, 2019 
April 26, 2005 November 7, 2018  
 
I am recommending that the written minutes for the Closed Sessions held 
on: 
 
March 24, 1987 April 26, 2005 April 26, 2011  
September 26, 2000 May 24, 2005 January 24, 2019 
October 24, 2000 May 23, 2006 March 28, 2019* 
   
remain closed to the public. 
 
*Minutes not yet approved by the Board 
 
I am also recommending that the written minutes for the Closed Session 
held on:  
 
November 7, 2018 December 13, 2018 
 
be made open to the public.   

 
ACTION 
REQUESTED: May we ask the Board to approve the written minutes so noted to remain 

closed to the public and the written minutes so noted to be opened to the 
public.  Further, we note that no lawsuit has been filed, and no valid court 
order has been received requiring the release of any audio recordings of 
any closed meeting and, therefore, pursuant to the statutory requirements, 
we recommend that none be released. 



 
SUMMARY 

MINUTES OF CLOSED SESSIONS 
Not yet opened to the public 

May 23, 2019 
 
March 24, 1987 
Closed Session held to discuss the appointment, employment, compensation, discipline, 
performance, or dismissal of an employee. 
 
September 26, 2000 
Closed Session held to discuss the appointment, employment, compensation, discipline, 
performance, or dismissal of an employee and to discuss collective negotiating matters. 
 
October 24, 2000 
Closed Session held to discuss the appointment, employment, compensation, discipline, 
performance, or dismissal of an employee and for approval of the minutes of the Closed Session 
of September 26, 2000. 
 
April 26, 2005 
Closed Session for deliberations concerning collective negotiating matters and approval of the 
Closed Session minutes for the meetings of May 25, 2004; July 27, 2004; August 11, 2004; 
August 23, 2004; August 24, 2004; and October 4, 2004. 
 
May 24, 2005 
Closed Session held for deliberations concerning collective negotiating matters; deliberations 
concerning salary schedules for one or more classes of employees; deliberations concerning the 
appointment, employment, compensation, discipline, performance or dismissal of a specific 
employee; and approval of the written Closed Session minutes for the meeting of April 26, 2005. 
 
May 23, 2006 
Closed Session for deliberations concerning salary schedules for one or more classes of 
employees; deliberations concerning the appointment, employment, compensation, discipline, 
performance or dismissal of a specific employee; probable litigation; and approval of the written 
Closed Session minutes for the meeting of April 25, 2006. 
 
April 26, 2011 
Closed Session for the appointment, employment, compensation, discipline, performance, or 
dismissal of specific employees; deliberations concerning collective negotiating matters; and  
approval of written Closed Session minutes for the meetings of September 2, 2010; September 
15, 2010; and November 3, 2010. 
 
November 7, 2018 
Closed Session to Discuss the Annual Evaluation of the President and Approval of the Written 
Closed Session Minutes of August 29, 2018. 
 
December 13, 2018 
Closed Session for Discussion of the Purchase or Lease of Real Property for the Use of the Public 
Body 



Summary 
Minutes of Closed Sessions 

Not yet opened to the public 
May 23, 2019 

 
January 24, 2019 
Closed Session for the Appointment, Employment, Compensation, Discipline, Performance, or 
Dismissal of Specific Employees of the Public Body. 
 
*March 28, 2019 
Closed Session for Deliberations Concerning Collective Negotiating Matters; Deliberations 
Concerning Salary Schedules for One or More Classes of Employees; and Approval of the 
Written Closed Session Minutes of November 7, 2018; December 13, 2018; and January 24, 
2019. 
 
       *Minutes not yet approved by the Board 
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AGENDA ITEM: 13F 
 
AGENDA TITLE: BOARD CONSIDERATION OF BIDS FOR ELEVATOR 

MAINTENANCE 
 
RESOURCE:  Mike Cunningham  
 
MEETING DATE: May 23, 2019 
 
SUBMITTED FOR: ACTION 
 
SUMMARY: Bids were advertised in the Commercial News and the News Gazette, and 

submitted to Kone, Inc., Urbana, IL, Kone, Inc. (formerly Long Elevator), 
Riverton, IL, ThyssenKrupp Elevator Co., Indianapolis, IN, and 
ThyssenKrupp Elevator Co., Peoria, IL for a five-year contract for Elevator 
Maintenance. 

 
 We have seven elevators in four buildings on campus.  Specifications require 

the Contractor to provide complete maintenance and furnish all parts and 
labor, and comply with all requirements of current American Standard Safety 
Codes to maintain all six campus elevators and one dumb-waiter in a safe 
operating condition with minimum downtime.  The Contractor will also 
provide a 24 hour, 7 days per week answering service to dispatch service 
personnel. 

 
 The bids were opened at 10:30 AM, Tuesday, May 7, 2019 with the 

following annual cost results. 
 
 $ 11,388.00 Kone, Inc., Urbana, IL 
                                  $ 12,000.00 ThyssenKrupp Elevator Co., Indianapolis, IN 
 NO BID ThyssenKrupp Elevator Co., Peoria, IL 
  
                                 
 The college paid $9,420.00 per year for the previous five-year period.   
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
ACTION 
REQUESTED: May we ask the Board to consider the bid from Kone, Inc in the amount of  
 $ 11,388.00 per year for a five-year Elevator Maintenance Contract.   
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AGENDA ITEM: 13G 
 
AGENDA TITLE: BOARD CONSIDERATION OF BIDS FOR TRASH REMOVAL 
 
RESOURCE:  Mike Cunningham  
 
MEETING DATE: May 23, 2019 
 
SUBMITTED FOR: ACTION 
 
SUMMARY: Bids were advertised in the Commercial News and the News Gazette and 

submitted to Republic Services, Danville, IL, Crane Roll-Off Service, 
Danville, IL, and Area Disposal Services, Champaign, IL for a five-year 
contract for Trash Removal service. 

 
 Specifications require the Contractor to provide all labor and equipment 

necessary to remove trash per a specified weekly schedule at eight locations 
on campus.  Contractor must maintain all dumpsters and surrounding area in 
an acceptable, sanitized condition. 

 
 The bids were opened at 10:00 AM, Tuesday, May 7, 2019 with the 

following cost per year results. 
 
 $ 18,398.32 Republic Services, Danville, IL 
 $ 50,000.00 Crane Roll-Off Service, Danville, IL 
 Declined to Bid Area Disposal Service, Inc., Champaign, IL 
 
  
 
 The College paid $17,250.00 per year for the previous five-year period. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
ACTION 
REQUESTED: May we ask the Board to consider the low bid from Allied Waste in the 

amount of $ 18,398.32 per year for a five-year Trash Removal Contract.   
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AGENDA ITEM: 13H 
 
AGENDA TITLE: BOARD CONSIDERATION OF BIDS FOR TERMITE AND PEST 

CONTROL 
 
RESOURCE:  Mike Cunningham  
 
MEETING DATE: May 23, 2019 
 
SUBMITTED FOR: ACTION 
 
SUMMARY: Bids were advertised in the Commercial News and the News Gazette and 

submitted to Terminix Company, Danville, IL, Ecolab, St. Paul, MN, and 
Orkin, Inc., Champaign, IL for a 5-year contract for Pest Control Services. 

 
 Specifications require the Contractor to use Integrated Pest Management 

(IPM) Principles, affording the least possible hazard to people, property, and 
the environment.  Bid specs are for inspection and treatment of eleven 
campus buildings.  Contractor must guarantee control of pests (including 
termites), and will be liable for any damage and/or repairs necessary as a 
result. 

 
 The bids were opened at 10:30 AM, Wednesday May 8, 2019 with the 

following annual cost results. 
 
 $ 7,925.00 Terminix Company, Danville, IL 
                                    Declined to Bid Orkin, Inc., Champaign, IL 
 NO BID Ecolab, Inc., St. Paul, MN 
  
              
                                  
 The College paid $ 7,281.00 per year for the previous five-year period. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
ACTION 
REQUESTED: May we ask the Board to consider the bid from Terminix Company in the 

amount of $ 7,925.00 per year for a five-year Pest Control Contract.   
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Board Consideration of Bids for  
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AGENDA ITEM:  13I 
 
AGENDA TITLE: BOARD CONSIDERATION OF BIDS FOR FIRE ALARMS, 

INTRUSION ALARMS, AND SECURITY CAMERA MAINTENANCE 
 
DATE:   May 23, 2019 
 
RESOURCE:: Mike Cunningham 
 
SUBMITTED FOR: ACTION  
 
SUMMARY Bids were advertised in the Commercial News and the News Gazette and 

sent to twelve contractors for Fire Alarm Maintenance, Security Camera 
Maintenance, and Intrusion Alarm Maintenance five-year contracts.  Fire 
alarm panels are in every building with 846 components, 8 intrusion 
alarms in 5 buildings, and 178 security cameras on campus.  The Fire 
Alarm and Intrusion Alarm systems are to be monitored by a UL certified 
monitoring station.  The bid also specified providing 24-hour, 7 day a 
week emergency service.   

 
Contractors were asked to bid on the maintenance for all three systems 
with the low total bid considered for recommendation.  Costs for these 
systems are funded through the Tort Liability fund. 
 
The previous contract for fire alarm maintenance was $14,250, for 
intrusion alarms was $8,184, and security camera maintenance was 
$10,200 for a total cost of $32,634 per year. 

 
 Bids were opened at 11:00 AM May 7, 2019 with the following results: 
 
Fire           Intrusion     Security      TOTAL 
Alarms          Alarms     Cameras     ANNUAL 
 
$14,250.00   $8,184.00   $10,200.00   $32,634.00    F.E. Moran Alarm and Monitoring, Champaign, IL 
$71,280.00 $40,397.00  $63,607.00 $174,284.00 * Barcom Security, Swansea, IL - *error in addition 
Declined to Bid          Affiliated Customer Service, Downers Grove, IL 
Declined to Bid         (2) Getz Fire Equipment, Normal, IL & Peoria IL 
Declined to Bid          Siemens, St. Louis, MO 
NO BID         George Alarm Company, Springfield, IL 
NO BID          DI Networks, Champaign, IL  
NO BID         Glesco Electric, Urbana, IL 
NO BID         Imperial Surveillance, Arlington Heights, IL 
NO BID         Koener Electric, Bartonville, ILL 
NO BID         Thompson Electronics Co., Peroria, IL 
NO BID         Automatic Fire Sprinkler, Normal, IL 
 
 
ACTION  May we ask the Board to consider the low bid from F.E. Moran, Inc.  
REQUESTED: for Fire Alarm, Intrusion Alarm, and Security Camera Maintenance in the 

amount of $32,634.00 per year for five years. 
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AGENDA ITEM: 13J 
 
AGENDA TITLE: BOARD CONSIDERATION TO LEASE TWO (2) MINIBUSES. 
 
RESOURCE:  Mike Cunningham 
 
MEETING DATE: May 23, 2019 
 
SUBMITTED FOR: ACTION 
 
SUMMARY: Bids were advertised in the Commercial News and News Gazette and 

submitted to Bus Service, Canal Winchester, OH, Midwest Transit 
Equipment, Kankakee, IL, Southern Bus & Mobility, Breese, IL, Courtesy 
Motors, Danville, IL, Master’s Transportation, Belton, MO, Central States 
Bus Sales, Fenton, MO, and Best Bus Sales, Des Plaines, IL for leasing two 
(2) 2019 minibuses.  One of these minibuses will be a 15-passenger bus and 
one will be a Wheelchair Accessible 12-passenger plus 2 wheelchair 
positions.  These minibuses are on the FY-19 Capital Equipment list.  The 
Bid Specs specified the lease would be awarded to the low responsible bidder 
of the TOTAL price per month for BOTH Minibuses. 

 
 Bids were opened at 10:00 AM Wednesday, May 8, 2019 with the following 

results. 
     Wheelchair  
 15-Passenger Accessible    Total  
 
   $ 1,281.00  $ 1,296.00 $ 2,577.00 Midwest Transit Equipment 
   $ 1,723.00  $ 1,792.00 $ 3,515.00 Best Bus Sales 
   Bid Received Late    Central States Bus Sales 
   NO BID     Master’s Transportation, Inc. 
   NO BID     Courtesy Motors 

  NO BID     Southern Bus & Mobility 
  NO BID     Bus Service 
   
     

 The most recent lease agreement was $806.00 per month for a 15-passenger 
minibus and $886.00 per month for a wheelchair accessible minibus.  It was 
determined that a three-year replacement cycle for leased minibuses promotes 
a safe method of transportation with a lower risk of mechanical failure. 
   
 
 

ACTION: May we ask the Board to consider the low bid from Midwest Transit 
Equipment in the amount of $1,281.00 per month to lease the 15-Passenger 
Minibus and $1,296.00 per month for the Wheelchair Accessible Minibus for 
a total of $2,577.00 per month for both vehicles. 
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 BOARD AGENDA ITEM 15 

 
 
 
 
 

  
Closed Session for Deliberations Concerning Collective Negotiating  

Matters; Deliberations Concerning Salary Schedules for One  
or More Classes of Employees; and Approval of the Written  

Closed Session Minutes of March 28, 2019
     
 
 
  
 
  
 
 
 
 
  
 
 



 
 
 
 
 

AGENDA ITEM 15 
 

MOTION FOR CLOSED SESSION 
 
 
BE IT RESOLVED, in accordance with the provisions of Chapter 120/2(c 2, 21) of the 
Open Meetings Act, the Board of Trustees of Community College District #507 shall 
enter a Closed Session for deliberations concerning collective negotiating matters; 
deliberations concerning salary schedules for one or more classes of employees; and 
approval of the written Closed Session minutes of March 28, 2019.               
 
 
Dated this 23rd day of May, 2019. 
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